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SENATE CAPITAL OUTLAY REQUEST 1215 
 

STATE OF NEW MEXICO 

45TH LEGISLATURE - SECOND SESSION - 2002 

REQUESTED BY Ramsay L. Gorham  

 
 
 
 
 
 
FOR ALBUQUERQUE PUBLIC SCHOOL DISTRICT PROJECTS IN SENATE DISTRICT 10 IN 
BERNALILLO COUNTY. 
 
 

I request that the following capital outlay projects be funded: 
 

• to the state department of public education 
 

eight thousand dollars ($8,000) for educational technology at Mission avenue elementary school 
in the Albuquerque public school district in Bernalillo county; 
 
seventeen thousand dollars ($17,000) for educational technology at Petroglyph elementary school 
in the Albuquerque public school district in Bernalillo county; 
 
eight thousand dollars ($8,000) for educational technology at Corrales elementary school in the 
Albuquerque public school district in Bernalillo county; 
 
eight thousand dollars ($8,000) for educational technology at Arroyo del Oso elementary school in 
the Albuquerque public school district in Bernalillo county; 
 
twelve thousand dollars ($12,000) for educational technology at Los Ranchos elementary school 
in the Albuquerque public school district in Bernalillo county; 
 
twelve thousand dollars ($12,000) for educational technology at Dennis Chavez elementary school 
in the Albuquerque public school district in Bernalillo county; 
 
twelve thousand dollars ($12,000) for educational technology at Double Eagle elementary school 
in the Albuquerque public school district in Bernalillo county; 
 
twelve thousand dollars ($12,000) for educational technology at Edmund G. Ross elementary 
school in the Albuquerque public school district in Bernalillo county; 
 
seventeen thousand dollars ($17,000) for educational technology at Taylor middle school in the 
Albuquerque public school district in Bernalillo county; 
 
seventeen thousand dollars ($17,000) for educational technology at Taft middle school in the 
Albuquerque public school district in Bernalillo county; 
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seventeen thousand dollars ($17,000) for educational technology at Desert Ridge middle school in 
the Albuquerque public school district in Bernalillo county; 
 
thirty-two thousand dollars ($32,000) for educational technology at McKinley middle school in 
the Albuquerque public school district in Bernalillo county; 
 
twenty-five thousand dollars ($25,000) for the "smart" lab project at Cleveland middle school in 
the Albuquerque public school district in Bernalillo county; 
 
seventeen thousand dollars ($17,000) for educational technology at Madison middle school in the 
Albuquerque public school district in Bernalillo county; 
 
twenty-two thousand dollars ($22,000) for improving the telephone system at Valley high school 
in the Albuquerque public school district in Bernalillo county; 
 
eight thousand dollars ($8,000) for educational technology at Cibola high school in the 
Albuquerque public school district in Bernalillo county; 
 
twenty-two thousand dollars ($22,000) for educational technology at Del Norte high school in the 
Albuquerque public school district in Bernalillo county; 
 
twenty-two thousand dollars ($22,000) for educational technology at La Cueva high school in the 
Albuquerque public school district in Bernalillo county; 
 
twelve thousand dollars ($12,000) to upgrade the soccer field at Alameda elementary school in the 
Albuquerque public school district in Bernalillo county; and 
 
twelve thousand dollars ($12,000) to purchase or construct a covered play structure at Alvarado 
elementary school in the Albuquerque public school district in Bernalillo county. 
 
 
 
 
 
 


