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County

Agency: AGING AND LONG-TERM SERVICES DEPARTMENT

TIJERAS SENIOR CENTER EXPAND IMPROVE 697,620 Tijeras

to plan, design, construct, expand and improve, including additional bathrooms, the senior center in Tijeras in 
Bernalillo county

Bernalillo

CHAVES CO SENIOR OLYMPICS ADMIN OFFICE RENOVATE 260,000 Roswell

to plan, design, renovate, construct, furnish and equip the senior Olympics office, including a telephone system, 
audio/video conferencing equipment, carpet, shelving and conference room, in Roswell in Chaves county

Chaves

CHAVES CO SENIOR OLYMPICS VAN PURCH 50,000 Roswell

to purchase and equip a van for the senior Olympics program in Roswell in Chaves county

Chaves

ROSWELL SENIOR CNTR ROOF REPLACE 385,000 Roswell

to replace the senior center roof in Roswell in Chaves county

Chaves

EAGLE NEST EMERGENCY GENERATOR PURCH 100,000 Eagle Nest

to plan, design, construct, purchase, equip and install an emergency generator at the senior center in Eagle Nest in 
Colfax county

Colfax

EAGLE NEST SENIOR CITIZEN MEAL DELIVERY VAN PURCH 48,000 Eagle Nest

to purchase and equip a temperature-controlled meal delivery van for the senior center in Eagle Nest in Colfax 
county

Colfax

EAGLE NEST SENIOR CTR KITCHEN 250,000 Eagle Nest

to plan, design, construct, equip, expand and furnish the kitchen at the senior center in Eagle Nest in Colfax county

Colfax

SCCSHD MATTRESSES PURCHASE 55,000

to purchase mattresses for the long-term care facility in Springer for the south central Colfax county special hospital 
district in Colfax county

Colfax

CASAMERO LAKE CHP SENIOR CENTER CONSTRUCT 1,600,000 Casamero Lake Chapte

to plan, design, construct, furnish and equip a senior center in the Casamero Lake chapter of the Navajo Nation in 
McKinley county

McKinley

TSE'LICHII/RED ROCK CHP SENIOR CENTER CONSTRUCT 300,000 Red Rock Chapter

to plan, design, construct, equip and furnish a senior center on the Tse'Lichii/Red Rock chapter of the Navajo 
Nation in McKinley county

McKinley

OHKAY OWINGEH SENIOR PRGM ROOMS CONSTRUCT 50,000 Ohkay Owingeh

to plan, design, construct, renovate and equip a health room and an arts and activities room for the senior program 
at Ohkay Owingeh in Rio Arriba county

Rio Arriba

CHAMISAL SENIOR CENTER IMPROVE 12,000 Chamisal

to plan, design, construct, renovate and purchase and install accessibility improvements to the front porch and 
entrance at the Chamisal senior center in Taos county

Taos

BELEN SENIOR CENTER KITCHEN EQUIP 85,000 Belen

to plan, design, purchase and install kitchen and meals equipment in the Belen senior center in Valencia county

Valencia

BELEN SENIOR CENTER RENOVATE 20,000 Belen

to plan, design, construct and equip improvements to the senior center in Belen in Valencia county

Valencia

BELEN SENIOR CENTER VEHICLES PURCHASE 56,000

to purchase and equip vehicles for the Belen senior center in Valencia county

Valencia

BELEN SENIOR CTR PARKING IMPROVE 475,000 Belen

to purchase property for and plan, design and construct improvements to the Belen senior center parking lot, 
including an entrance, emergency services access and accessibility improvements, in Belen in Valencia county

Valencia

MEADOWLAKE SENIOR CENTER INFO TECH 15,000 Meadow Lake

to purchase and install information technology, including related furniture, equipment and infrastructure, in the 
Meadowlake senior center in Valencia county

Valencia
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PERALTA SENIOR CENTER CONSTRUCT 850,000 Peralta

to acquire property for and to plan, design and construct a senior center in Peralta in Valencia county

Valencia

VALENCIA CO DEL RIO SENIOR CTR HVAC SYSTEM 20,000 Rio Communities

to plan, design, construct, equip and install a heating, ventilation and air conditioning system in the Del Rio senior 
center in Rio Communities in Valencia county

Valencia

Agency: DISTRICT ATTORNEYS, ADMINISTRATIVE OFFICE OF THE

AODA INFO TECH/SECURITY DEVICES & EQUIPMENT 360,000

to purchase and install information technology and related system upgrades, including equipment, furniture, 
infrastructure, storage, security appliances and security monitoring devices, in the administrative offices of the 
district attorneys in Santa Fe in Santa Fe county and in Albuquerque in Bernalillo county

Multiple Co

Agency: CULTURAL AFFAIRS DEPARTMENT

MUSEUM OF NATURAL HISTORY & SCIENCE IMPROVE 200,000 Albuquerque

to plan, design, construct, repair, equip, renovate and improve the facilities, exhibits and site, including purchase 
and installation of furniture and equipment, at the New Mexico museum of natural history and science in 
Albuquerque in Bernalillo county

Bernalillo

NATL HISPANIC CULTURAL CTR IMPROVE 280,000 Albuquerque

to plan, design, construct, purchase and improve the facilities, site, equipment and infrastructure at the national 
Hispanic cultural center in Albuquerque in Bernalillo county

Bernalillo

CCA CTR FOR CONTEMPORARY ARTS SAFETY SANTA FE 265,000 Santa Fe

to plan, design, construct, purchase and install parking lot security cameras, fire suppression sprinkler systems, 
accessibility improvements throughout the buildings and parking area and improvements to the main gallery 
entrance roof at the center for contemporary arts in Santa Fe in Santa Fe county

Santa Fe

PALACE OF THE GOVERNORS REPAIR & UPGRADE 402,825 Santa Fe

to plan, design, construct, repair, renovate and make upgrades to the palace of the governors facility and site in 
Santa Fe in Santa Fe county

Santa Fe

Agency: CAPITAL PROGRAM FUND

FORT BAYARD THEATER IMPROVE SANTA CLARA 294,000 Santa Clara

to plan, design and construct improvements, including repairing and replacing doors and door jambs, to the Fort 
Bayard New Deal theater and recreation hall in Grant county

Grant

Agency: COURT -  2ND JUDICIAL DISTRICT

2ND JUD DIST PAPER STORAGE UNITS PRCHS INSTALL 450,000 Albuquerque

to purchase and install high-density file storage units and to purchase related equipment for the second judicial 
district court in Albuquerque in Bernalillo county

Bernalillo

Agency: COURT -  8TH JUDICIAL DISTRICT

8TH JUD DIST COURTROOM/JURY ROOM IMPROVE 1,050,000 Clayton

to plan, design, construct, renovate, equip and improve the courtroom and jury room of the eighth judicial district 
courthouse in Clayton in Union county

Union

Agency: DISTRICT ATTORNEY OF THE  2ND JUDICIAL DISTRICT

2ND JUD DIST ATTORNEY'S OFFICE INFO TECH/EQUIP 1,000,000 Albuquerque

to purchase and install equipment and information technology, including related  infrastructure and furniture, for the 
second judicial district attorney's office in Albuquerque in Bernalillo county

Bernalillo
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Agency: ENVIRONMENT, DEPARTMENT OF

ALB-BERN CO WUA DON RESERVOIR PUMP STATION 175,000

to design, replace and construct the Don reservoir pump station at the Bernalillo county industrial park for the 
Albuquerque Bernalillo county water utility authority in Bernalillo county

Bernalillo

ALB-BERN CO WUA N EDITH WATER & SEWER INFRA 1,500,000

to acquire easements and rights of way and to plan, design and construct the north Edith water and sanitary sewer 
infrastructure near northern Edith boulevard in Bernalillo county

Bernalillo

TIJERAS WATER WELL CONSTRUCT 250,000 Tijeras

to plan, design and construct a water well in Tijeras in Bernalillo county

Bernalillo

TIJERAS WWATER SYS 250,000 Tijeras

to plan, design, construct, expand and improve a wastewater system in Tijeras in Bernalillo county

Bernalillo

RESERVE WWATER PLANT & SYS IMPROVE 200,000 Reserve

to acquire rights of way and property and to plan, design, construct, furnish and equip improvements to a 
wastewater treatment plant and effluent system for Reserve in Catron county

Catron

CHAVES CO SOLID WASTE CONVENIENCE CENTERS PHASE 3 141,000

to plan, design, purchase, construct, equip and install solid waste convenience centers in Chaves county

Chaves

HAGERMAN WATER TRANSMISSION LINE 500,000 Hagerman

to plan, design and construct water transmission lines, including valves, gates, fittings and gauges, in Hagerman in 
Chaves county

Chaves

HAGERMAN WWATER LAGOON PHASE 1 500,000 Hagerman

to plan, design, construct and equip phase one of a wastewater evaporation lagoon, including valves, gates, fittings 
and gauges, in Hagerman in Chaves county

Chaves

HAGERMAN WWATER SYSTEM IMPROVE 500,000 Hagerman

to plan, design, construct and equip wastewater system improvements, including line replacements, valves, gates, 
fittings and gauges, in Hagerman in Chaves county

Chaves

LAKE ARTHUR WATER SYSTEM 700,000 Lake Arthur

to plan, design, improve and construct a water system, including electrical work, pumps, casing impellers, 
transmission lines, storage tank upgrade, meters and readers, fire hydrants and appurtenances, in Lake Arthur in 
Chaves county

Chaves

LAKE ARTHUR WWATER SYSTEM 600,000 Lake Arthur

to plan, design and construct a wastewater system, including sump pumps, collector lines, mains, manholes and 
stub-outs, in Lake Arthur in Chaves county

Chaves

ANGEL FIRE WATER STORAGE TANKS REPAIR 1,688,750 Angel Fire

to plan, design, construct and repair water storage tanks in Angel Fire in Colfax county

Colfax

EAGLE NEST SEWAGE LAGOONS DECOMMISSION 1,188,000 Eagle Nest

for decommissioning two sewage lagoons and for land restoration in Eagle Nest Lake state park in Colfax county

Colfax

EAGLE NEST WATER SYS IMPROVE PHASE 3 2,888,312 Eagle Nest

to plan, design, purchase and construct phase three water system improvements, including replacing and extending 
water lines and installing fire hydrants, gate valves and meters, in Eagle Nest in Colfax county

Colfax

MAXWELL SEWER LAGOON IMPROVE 100,000 Maxwell

to plan, design, purchase and install a liner for the sewer lagoon at the wastewater system plant in Maxwell in 
Colfax county

Colfax

MAXWELL SEWER LAGOON LINERS 100,000 Maxwell

to plan, design, repair and replace the sewer lagoon liners in Maxwell in Colfax county

Colfax

MAXWELL WATER STORAGE TANK 50,000 Maxwell

to plan, design, purchase and install a water storage tank in Maxwell in Colfax county

Colfax
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RATON STREET IMPROVEMENTS 500,000 Raton

to plan, design and construct street and drainage improvements in Raton in Colfax county

Colfax

SPRINGER WWATER SYSTEM IMPROVEMENTS 500,000 Springer

to plan, design, construct and equip wastewater system improvements, including upgrades to the plant and 
construction of sewage lagoons and a discharge system, in Springer in Colfax county

Colfax

ANTHONY WSD DESERT AIRE WASTEWATER SYSTEM 50,000

to plan, design and construct a wastewater collection system in Desert Aire in the Anthony water and sanitation 
district in Dona Ana county

Dona Ana

SUNLAND PARK LIFT STATIONS & MANHOLES 200,000 Sunland Park

to plan, design and construct improvements to lift stations and manholes for the Camino Real regional utility 
authority in Sunland Park in Dona Ana county

Dona Ana

LOVING SEWER COLLECTION SYS IMPROVE 704,733 Loving

to plan, design and construct sewer collection system improvements in Loving in Eddy county

Eddy

LOVING WATER SYSTEM IMPROVEMENTS 1,039,752 Loving

to plan, design and construct improvements to the water system in Loving in Eddy county

Eddy

BAYARD WATER WELL 620,000 Bayard

to plan, design, drill, construct and equip a supplemental water well and connecting infrastructure for the water 
supply system in Bayard in Grant county

Grant

CASAS ADOBES MDWCA SYSTEM IMPROVE GRANT CO 100,000 Mimbres

to plan, design, construct, equip and furnish improvements to the Casas Adobes mutual domestic water consumers 
association water system in Grant county

Grant

HURLEY WATER SYSTEM IMPROVE 200,000 Hurley

to plan, design, construct, equip and furnish improvements to the water system in Hurley in Grant county

Grant

LORDSBURG WATER SYSTEM IMPROVE 500,000 Lordsburg

to plan, design, construct, equip and furnish water system improvements in Lordsburg in Hidalgo county

Hidalgo

HOBBS SEWER TRUNK LINE CONSTRUCT & REPLACE 12,000,000 Hobbs

to plan, design, construct, remove and replace sewer trunk lines and manholes, including bypass pumping and 
materials disposal, in Hobbs in Lea county

Lea

HOBBS WWATER AEROBIC DIGESTION BASINS & EQUIP 7,600,000 Hobbs

to design, construct, renovate, expand and equip aerobic digestion basins at the wastewater reclamation facility in 
Hobbs in Lea county

Lea

HOBBS WWATER AQUIFER RECHARGE/RECOVERY SYS 2,450,000 Hobbs

to construct and equip an aquifer recharge and recovery system for the wastewater reclamation facility in Hobbs in 
Lea county

Lea

HOBBS WWATER RECLAMATION TRTMNT PROCESS CONSTRUCT 2,000,000 Hobbs

to plan, design and construct a tertiary treatment process system at the wastewater reclamation facility in Hobbs in 
Lea county

Lea

TATUM WATER SYSTEM IMPROVE 50,000 Tatum

to plan, design and construct water system improvements, including replacing water lines and the purchase and 
installation of hydrants and meters, in Tatum in Lea county

Lea

CARRIZOZO WELL AND WELL HOUSES 500,000 Carrizozo

to plan, design, construct, purchase and equip a well and well houses in Carrizozo in Lincoln county

Lincoln

LINCOLN CO GREENTREE SWA FRONT LOAD WASTE TRUCK 275,000 Ruidoso Downs

to purchase and equip a front-loading solid waste collection truck for the Greentree solid waste authority in Ruidoso 
Downs in Lincoln county

Lincoln

LINCOLN CO GREENTREE SWA ROOF REPLACE 100,000 Ruidoso Downs

to plan, design and construct improvements and replacement of the roof, including ceiling panels and insulation, at 
the Greentree solid waste authority administration building in Ruidoso Downs in Lincoln county

Lincoln
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LINCOLN CO GREENTREE SWA SIDE LOAD WASTE TRUCK 290,000 Ruidoso Downs

to purchase and equip a side-loading solid waste collection truck for the Greentree solid waste authority in Ruidoso 
Downs in Lincoln county

Lincoln

LINCOLN CO GREENTREE SWA TRASH UNITS 250,600 Ruidoso Downs

to purchase self-contained trash units, dumpsters and carts for the Greentree solid waste authority in Ruidoso 
Downs in Lincoln county

Lincoln

LINCOLN CO GREENTREE SWA WASTE TRUCK & ROLLOFF 230,000 Ruidoso Downs

to purchase and equip a solid waste collection truck, including roll-off system, for the Greentree solid waste 
authority in Ruidoso Downs in Lincoln county

Lincoln

RUIDOSO SEWER SYSTEM EXTEND 300,000 Ruidoso

to acquire easements and to plan, design, construct and equip sewer system lines, lift stations, manholes, force 
mains and clean outs in Ruidoso in Lincoln county

Lincoln

RUIDOSO SEWER SYSTEM IMPROVEMENTS 500,000 Ruidoso

to plan, design, renovate, construct, relocate and equip sewer system improvements in Ruidoso in Lincoln county

Lincoln

RUIDOSO WATER TREATMENT PLANT IMPROVE 750,000 Ruidoso

to plan, design, construct and equip improvements to the Alto water treatment plant in Ruidoso in Lincoln county

Lincoln

COLUMBUS WATER SYSTEM IMPROVE 230,000 Columbus

to plan, design, construct, equip and furnish improvements to the water system in Columbus in Luna county

Luna

AGUA PURA MDWC & MSWA WATER SYS IMPROVE 25,000 Chacon

to plan, design and construct water system improvements for The Agua Pura mutual domestic water consumers 
and mutual sewage works association in Mora county

Mora

BUENA VISTA MDWC & SWA WATER SYS IMPROVE 67,000

to plan, design and construct water system improvements for the Buena Vista mutual domestic water consumer's 
and sewage works association in Mora county

Mora

MORA CO BACKHOE 96,000

to purchase and equip a backhoe for the solid waste department in Mora county

Mora

UPPER HOLMAN MDWC & MSWA WATER SYS IMPROVE 50,000 Holman

to plan, design and construct water system improvements for the Upper Holman mutual domestic water consumers 
and mutual sewage works association in Mora county

Mora

CLOUDCROFT WATER LINES IMPROVE 805,000 Cloudcroft

to plan, design, construct, equip and replace water lines in Cloudcroft in Otero county

Otero

CLOUDCROFT WATER TREATMENT PLANT IMPROVE 650,000 Cloudcroft

to plan, design and construct improvements and purchase and install equipment for the domestic water treatment 
plant in Cloudcroft in Otero county

Otero

TULAROSA WATER SYSTEM IMPROVE 300,000 Tularosa

to plan, design, construct, purchase and install equipment and improvements to the Tularosa water plant and 
systems, including the water diversion intake, sandbox filtration and electrical source, in Tularosa in Otero county

Otero

TULAROSA WWATER SYS IMPROVE 100,000 Tularosa

to plan, design, purchase, construct and install improvements to the wastewater system in Tularosa in Otero county

Otero

TUCUMCARI SEWER MAIN REPLACE 250,000 Tucumcari

to plan, design and replace a collapsed sewer main in Tucumcari in Quay county

Quay

ABIQUIU MDWCA & MSWA WATER SYSTEM IMPROVE 130,000

to plan, design, construct, equip and install improvements to the Abiquiu mutual domestic water consumers 
association and mutual sewage works association water system in Rio Arriba county

Rio Arriba

AGUA SANA WUA RADIO READ METERS 200,000 Hernandez

to plan, purchase and install radio read meters for the Agua Sana water users association in Rio Arriba county

Rio Arriba
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ALCALDE MDWC & MSWA WATER SYS IMPROVE 200,000 Alcalde

to design and construct a water well, pump house and disinfection system for the Alcalde mutual domestic water 
consumers' and mutual sewage works association in Rio Arriba county

Rio Arriba

ANCONES MDW & WWCA WATER SYS CONSTRUCT 500,000 La Madera

to plan, design and construct a water system for the Ancones mutual domestic water and wastewater consumers 
association in Rio Arriba county

Rio Arriba

CHAMA SEWER LINE EXTEND 800,000 Chama

to plan, design and construct a sewer line extension in Chama in Rio Arriba county

Rio Arriba

CHAMITA MDWC & SWA WATER SYSTEM IMPROVE 25,000 Ohkay Owingeh

to plan, design and construct improvements to the water system for the Chamita mutual domestic water consumers 
and sewage works association in Rio Arriba county

Rio Arriba

CORDOVA MDWCA WATER SYSTEM IMPROVEMENTS 25,000 Cordova

to plan, design and construct improvements to the water system for the Cordova mutual domestic water consumers 
association in Rio Arriba county

Rio Arriba

ESPANOLA N PRINCE DR SEWER LINE 500,000 Española

to plan, design and construct a sewer line near north Prince drive in Espanola in Rio Arriba county

Rio Arriba

ESPANOLA NM HWY 76 SEWER LINE EXTEND 1,070,000 Española

to plan, design and construct a sewer line extension along New Mexico highway 76 in Espanola in Rio Arriba county

Rio Arriba

ESPANOLA RIVERSIDE DR WATER LINES UPGRADE 75,000 Española

to plan, design, construct and upgrade water lines along Riverside drive in Espanola in Rio Arriba county

Rio Arriba

PORTALES WATER SYSTEM & FIRE PROTECTION IMPROVE 484,200 Portales

to plan, design and construct fire protection and water circulation upgrades in Portales in Roosevelt county

Roosevelt

PORTALES WELL FIELD IMPROVE 730,000 Portales

to plan, design and construct well field improvements in Portales in Roosevelt county

Roosevelt

BLOOMFIELD SECOND SOURCE WATER SUPPLY PHASE 2 321,000 Bloomfield

to plan, design and construct phase two of the second source water supply project in Bloomfield in San Juan county

San Juan

FARMINGTON ZONE 2P WATERLINE CONSTRUCT 9,927,297 Farmington

to plan, design and construct the zone 2P water line in Farmington in San Juan county

San Juan

NAVAJO DAM DWC & MSWC STORAGE TANK SAN JUAN CO 60,000

to purchase land and to plan, design, purchase and construct a water storage tank for the Navajo dam domestic 
water consumers and mutual sewage works cooperative in San Juan county

San Juan

NAVAJO DAM DWC & MSWC WATER METERS SAN JUAN CO 20,000

to purchase and install water meters and repair water meter parts for the Navajo dam domestic water consumers 
and mutual sewage works cooperative in San Juan county

San Juan

CHAPELLE MDWCA IMPROVE SAN MIGUEL CO 87,900 Serafina

to plan, design and construct water system improvements for Chapelle mutual domestic water consumers 
association in Serafina in San Miguel county

San Miguel

E PECOS MDWCA WWATER SYSTEM IMPROVE 50,000

to plan, design and construct a sewer system and connection to the waste water treatment plant for the east Pecos 
mutual domestic water consumers' association in San Miguel county

San Miguel

EL CERRITO MDWCA SYS IMPROVE SAN MIGUEL COUNTY 25,000 El Cerrito

to plan, design and construct improvements to the water system of El Cerrito mutual domestic water consumers 
association in El Cerrito in San Miguel county

San Miguel

EL CRESTON MDWCA WATER SYS IMPROVE SAN MIGUEL CO 150,000

to plan, design and construct improvements to the water system of El Creston mutual domestic water consumers 
association in San Miguel county

San Miguel

EL VALLE WATER ALLIANCE SYS IMPROVE SAN MIGUEL CO 25,000

to plan, design and construct water system improvements for El Valle water alliance in San Miguel county

San Miguel
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LA CUEVA MDWCA WATER SYSTEM IMPROVE 168,978 Pecos

to plan, design and construct improvements to the water system for La Cueva mutual domestic water consumers 
association in San Miguel county

San Miguel

LAS VEGAS WATER LINES REPLACE 2,300,000 Las Vegas

to plan, design and replace water lines, including Moreland, north Gonzales, West, East, Placita del Llano, Bosque 
drive, Rita drive, Pecos and First street, in Las Vegas in San Miguel county

San Miguel

LAS VEGAS WWATER LIFT STATIONS EQUIP/REPLACE 900,000 Las Vegas

to plan, design, construct and replace wastewater lift station pumps, supports and electrical systems in Las Vegas 
in San Miguel county

San Miguel

PECOS WATER SYSTEM 150,000 Pecos

to plan, design, construct, equip, renovate and improve the water system in Pecos in San Miguel county

San Miguel

BERNALILLO WATER & SEWER LINES RELOCATE 700,000 Bernalillo

to plan, design, construct and relocate water and sewer lines along United States highway 550 in Bernalillo in 
Sandoval county

Sandoval

BERNALILLO WELL 2 ARSENIC TREATMENT FACILITY 1,550,000 Bernalillo

to plan, design and construct an arsenic treatment facility for water well 2 in Bernalillo in Sandoval county

Sandoval

CANON MDWC & MSWA PHASE 3 IMPROVE SANDOVAL CO 40,000

to plan, design and construct phase 3 improvements to the water system and main lines of the Canon mutual 
domestic water consumers' and mutual sewage works association in Canon in Sandoval county

Sandoval

CORRALES ANGEL HILL FIRE PROTECT WATER SYS PH 1 35,000 Corrales

to plan, design and construct a well, tank, utilities and water distribution system for phase 1 of the Angel Hill fire 
protection water system in Corrales in Sandoval county

Sandoval

CUBA WATER SYSTEM IMPROVE 500,000 Cuba

to plan, design and construct improvements to the water system in Cuba in Sandoval county

Sandoval

JEMEZ SPRINGS WATER TANKS IMPROVE 326,758 Jemez Springs

to plan, design and improve drinking water storage tanks for the Jemez Springs domestic water association in 
Jemez Springs in Sandoval county

Sandoval

PLACITAS WATER SYS IMPROVE 395,000 Placitas

to plan, design and construct improvements, including rehabilitating the existing well and adding storage tanks, 
water lines, a fire hydrant and a building, to the water system in Placitas in Sandoval county

Sandoval

REGINA MDWCA WATER SYSTEM 50,000 Regina

to plan, design and construct a water system for the Regina mutual domestic water consumers association in 
Sandoval county

Sandoval

EDGEWOOD WWATER COLLECTION SYS INFRA IMPROVE 1,673,000 Edgewood

to plan, design, construct and equip wastewater collection system infrastructure improvements in Edgewood in 
Santa Fe county

Santa Fe

LA BAJADA COMMUNITY DITCH & MDWA WATER LINE 20,000

to plan, design, purchase, construct and install a water line to connect the tank and system of la Bajada community 
ditch and mutual domestic water association in Santa Fe county

Santa Fe

NAMBE PUEBLO WATER & WWATER SYSTEMS CONSTRUCT 500,000 Nambe Pueblo

to plan, design, construct and improve the water and wastewater systems, including the purchase and installation of 
a water tank and sewer lines, in the Pueblo of Nambe in Santa Fe county

Santa Fe

NAMBE PUEBLO WATER & WWATER SYSTEMS IMPROVE 500,000 Nambe Pueblo

to plan, design, purchase, construct, install and make improvements to the water and wastewater systems, 
including a water storage tank and sewer lines, in the Pueblo of Nambe in Santa Fe county

Santa Fe

SANTA FE WATER SYSTEM PUMP STATION & PIPELINE 170,000 Santa Fe

to design and construct an open booster pump station and water transmission pipeline in Santa Fe in Santa Fe 
county

Santa Fe
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ELEPHANT BUTTE WWATER SYSTEM CONSTRUCT PH 1 660,000 Elephant Butte

to plan, design and construct phase 1 improvements to the wastewater system and collection lines in Elephant 
Butte in Sierra county and to make improvements to the Sierra county regional wastewater treatment plant

Sierra

SIERRA CO LANDFILL CONSTRUCT 1,225,000

to acquire property for and to plan, design and construct a landfill in Sierra county

Sierra

CHAMISAL MDWCA FENCING & CULTURAL CTR 198,200 Chamisal

to purchase and install fencing and a culvert and to plan, design and construct a multipurpose building and cultural 
enrichment center in Chamisal in Taos county

Taos

EL PRADO WATER SYSTEM IMPROVE 100,000 El Prado

to plan, design and construct improvements to the water system in El Prado in Taos county

Taos

EL VALLE DE LOS RANCHOS WSD IMPROVE PHASE 2D-1C 50,000

to plan, design and construct phase 2D-1C of the sewer system, including installing sewer mains, manholes and 
service lines, in the Talpa area in Taos county

Taos

EL VALLE DE LOS RANCHOS WSD SEWER SYS PHASE 4A-1 60,000

to plan, design and construct phase 4A-1 of the sewer system, including a sewer main and connections, in the 
Llano Quemado area in Taos county

Taos

LOWER ARROYO HONDO MDWC & MSWA WATER SYS IMPROVE 150,000 Arroyo Hondo

to plan, design and construct improvements to the water system, including a booster pump system, for the Lower 
Arroyo Hondo mutual domestic water consumers and mutual sewage works association in Taos county

Taos

LOWER DES MONTES MDWCA WATER LINES & EQUIP 20,000

to plan, design and construct water lines and to purchase and equip a digital water meter reader for the lower Des 
Montes mutual domestic water consumers association in Taos county

Taos

OJO CALIENTE MDWCA WATER SYS IMPROVE 25,000 Ojo Caliente

to plan, design and construct water system improvements for the Ojo Caliente mutual domestic water consumers 
association in Taos county

Taos

QUESTA WATER & SEWER LINES IMPROVE 565,000 Questa

to plan, design, construct, extend and make improvements to the water and sewer lines in Questa in Taos county

Taos

QUESTA WELL & WATER SYSTEM IMPROVE 1,509,950 Questa

to acquire property for and to plan, design, construct and make improvements to the water well and water 
distribution and storage systems in Questa in Taos county

Taos

RED RIVER FIRE HYDRANTS CONSTRUCT 330,000 Red River

to plan, design, construct, equip, purchase and install fire hydrants in Red River in Taos county

Taos

RED RIVER WATER LINE REPLACE 200,000 Red River

to plan, design, construct, replace, equip and install water lines in Red River in Taos county

Taos

RED RIVER WATER SYSTEM SCADA 431,289 Red River

to plan, design, construct, equip and install a supervisory control and data acquisition system for the water system 
in Red River in Taos county

Taos

VADITO MDWCA WATER SYS IMPROVE 25,000 Vadito

to plan, design and construct water system improvements for the Vadito mutual domestic water consumers 
association in Taos county

Taos

MORIARTY SEWER PLANT EQUIPMENT PURCHASE 51,000

to purchase and install variable frequency drives on the motors in the sewer plant in Moriarty in Torrance county

Torrance

TORREON STORM WATER FCILTIES UPGRADE 50,000 Torreon

to plan, design, construct, purchase, install and upgrade storm water management facilities in Torreon in Torrance 
county

Torrance

CLAYTON WATER STORAGE TANKS RENOVATE 150,000 Clayton

to plan, design, construct and renovate water storage tanks in Clayton in Union county

Union
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CLAYTON WATER WELL 9 IMPROVE 50,000 Clayton

to plan, design and construct improvements to water supply well nine in Clayton in Union county

Union

BELEN WATER & WWATER SCADA SYSTEM 300,000 Belen

to plan, design, construct, purchase and install a supervisory control and data acquisition system and related 
equipment and infrastructure for the water and wastewater system in Belen in Valencia county

Valencia

BOSQUE FARMS WWATER TRTMNT CLARIFIER 300,000 Bosque Farms

to design and construct a clarifier for the wastewater treatment plant in Bosque Farms in Valencia county

Valencia

LOS LUNAS WATER DELIVERY LOOP CONSTRUCT 2,800,000 Los Lunas

to construct an eastern water loop, including appurtenances, in Los Lunas in Valencia county

Valencia

LOS LUNAS WATER WELL 7 380,000 Los Lunas

to plan, design and construct a water well in Los Lunas in Valencia county

Valencia

PERALTA WWATER SYSTEM PHASE 1-C 560,000 Peralta

to plan, design, construct, equip and install phase 1-c of a wastewater collection system in Peralta in Valencia 
county

Valencia

Agency: TRANSPORTATION, DEPARTMENT OF

118TH ST WALKING TRAIL ALBUQUERQUE 105,000 Albuquerque

to plan, design and construct a walking trail along 118th street, including curb, gutter and intersection modifications, 
at Senator Dennis Chavez boulevard and 118th street in Albuquerque in Bernalillo county

Bernalillo

2ND ST & RIO BRAVO INTERSECTION IMPROVE BERN CO 600,000

to acquire easements and rights of way and to plan, design and construct road and utility infrastructure 
improvements to the 2nd street and Rio Bravo intersection in Bernalillo county

Bernalillo

4TH ST IMPROVE LOS RANCHOS DE ALB 5,086,000 Los Ranchos de Albuq

to purchase rights of way and property and to plan, design and construct improvements to Fourth street in Los 
Ranchos de Albuquerque in Bernalillo county

Bernalillo

ATRISCO DR IMPROVE BRIDGE/SAN YGNACIO-BERN CO 713,000

to acquire rights of way and to plan, design and construct road and storm drainage improvements to Atrisco drive 
from Bridge boulevard to San Ygnacio road in the south valley area of Bernalillo county

Bernalillo

ATRISCO DR SAN YGNACIO/ROSENDA GARCIA-BERN CO 695,000

to acquire rights of way and to plan, design and construct road and storm drainage improvements to Atrisco drive 
from San Ygnacio road to Rosenda Garcia road in the south valley area of Bernalillo county

Bernalillo

BERN CO DIST 2 ROADS IMPROVE 500,000

to plan, design and construct improvements to roads, including drainage and utility improvements, in county 
commission district 2 in Bernalillo county

Bernalillo

BERN CO DISTRICT 1 ROADS IMPROVE 500,000

to plan, design and construct improvements to roads, including drainage and utility improvements, in county 
commission district 1 in Bernalillo county

Bernalillo

BERN CO DISTRICT 4 ROADS IMPROVE 500,000

to plan, design and construct improvements to roads, including drainage and utility improvements, in county 
commission district 4 in Bernalillo county

Bernalillo

BERN CO DISTRICT 5 ROADS IMPROVE 500,000

to plan, design and construct improvements to roads, including drainage and utility improvements, in county 
commission district 5 in Bernalillo county

Bernalillo

BERN CO TRANSLOAD FACILITY RR TRACK 1,300,000

to plan, design and construct railroad track for an industrial rail transload facility in Bernalillo county

Bernalillo
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BOSQUE MEADOWS RD/OSV CTR PED IMPROVEMENTS 500,000 Albuquerque

to acquire rights of way and to plan, design, purchase and install pedestrian improvements, including a pedestrian-
activated signal system, pedestrian crossings and traffic signals, near Bosque Meadows road and the open space 
visitors center in Albuquerque in Bernalillo county

Bernalillo

GREENWICH RD SW IMPROVE-BERN CO 27,000

to plan, design and construct road and drainage improvements at the terminus of Greenwich road in the south 
valley area of Bernalillo county

Bernalillo

LA VEGA STORM DRAINAGE & ROAD IMPROVE 1,137,000

to acquire rights of way and to plan, design and construct storm drainage and road improvements, including an 
outfall, in the area including La Vega drive, Hardy avenue, Riverside drive and Ellington drive from El Serano court 
to the middle Rio Grande conservancy district's Riverside drain in the south valley area in Bernalillo county

Bernalillo

LADERA RD NW IMPROVE ALBUQUERQUE 1,000,000 Albuquerque

to acquire rights of way and to plan, design, construct and landscape Ladera road northwest, including pedestrian 
and traffic control features, between Gavin road and Coors boulevard in Albuquerque in Bernalillo county

Bernalillo

NEAT LN SW IMPROVE-BERN CO 690,000

to plan, design and construct road and drainage improvements to Neat lane in the south valley area of Bernalillo 
county

Bernalillo

NM HWYS 314/45/3I7 INTERSECTION ISLETA PUEBLO 70,000 Isleta Pueblo

to plan, design and construct the New Mexico highway 314, New Mexico highway 45 and New Mexico highway 317 
intersection improvements in the Pueblo of Isleta in Bernalillo county

Bernalillo

QUIET LANE GOFF BLVD/END IMPROVE BERN CO 643,000

to plan, design and construct road and drainage improvements along Quiet lane from Goff boulevard to the end of 
Quiet lane in the south valley area in Bernalillo county

Bernalillo

SUNSET RD SW NEETSIE DR TO GONZALES RD BERN CO 500,000

to plan, design and construct road and drainage improvements to Sunset road southwest between Neetsie drive 
and Gonzales road in the south valley area of Bernalillo county

Bernalillo

SUNSET RD SW TRUJILLO RD TO BRIDGE BLVD BERN CO 1,180,000

to design and construct road and drainage improvements to Sunset road southwest between Trujillo road and 
Bridge boulevard in the south valley area of Bernalillo county

Bernalillo

TIJERAS ROADS IMPROVE 295,000 Tijeras

to plan, design, construct and improve roads, including drainage, curbs, gutters, sidewalks and accessibility 
features, in Tijeras in Bernalillo county

Bernalillo

WILDWOOD LN SW IMPROVE-BERN CO 560,000

to plan, design and construct road and drainage improvements to Wildwood lane in the south valley area of 
Bernalillo county

Bernalillo

CHAVES CO BRIDGES IMPROVE 200,000

to plan, design, construct, repair and replace bridges, including the bridge on Miami road crossing the Hagerman 
canal, in Chaves county

Chaves

E HOBSON RD IMPROVE CHAVES CO 500,000

to plan, design, construct and improve east Hobson road, including installation of culverts and drainage 
improvements, in Chaves county

Chaves

S UNION AVE & S WASHINGTON AVE IMPROVE ROSWELL 1,000,000 Roswell

to plan, design, repair and construct roads and curbing, including accessible sidewalks, to south Union avenue and 
south Washington avenue from Jaffa avenue to Poe street in Roswell in Chaves county

Chaves

MILAN PEDESTRIAN ACCESS & STREETS IMPROVE 100,000 Milan

to plan, design and construct pedestrian access improvements and repairs to streets and sidewalks to comply with 
the Americans with Disabilities Act of 1990, including curbs, gutters and ramps, in Milan in Cibola county

Cibola

3RD ST IMPROVEMENTS SPRINGER 10,000 Springer

to plan, design and construct improvements, including median work, accessibility and lighting, to Third street in 
Springer in Colfax county

Colfax

Thursday, February 16, 2017 Page 10 of 51Projects Requested by Agency w Purpose 2



Capital Outlay Projects

List of Requested Projects by Agency

Project Title Total Project Cost

Legislative Council Service

       City

53rd Legislature, 1st Session, 2017

County

MAXWELL STREET IMPROVEMENTS 50,000 Maxwell

to plan, design and construct street and drainage improvements in Maxwell in Colfax county

Colfax

RATON STORMWATER DRAINAGE IMPROVE 250,000 Raton

to plan, design, repair and construct improvements to the storm water drainage system in Raton in Colfax county

Colfax

SPRINGER STREETS & SIDEWALKS IMPROVE 100,000 Springer

to plan, design and construct street improvements, including accessible sidewalks and roadways, drainage and 
lighting, in Springer in Colfax county

Colfax

CURRY CO RD 3 IMPROVE 180,000

to plan, design and construct improvements to county road 3 from New Mexico highway 348 to county road G in 
Curry county

Curry

CURRY CO RD 7 IMPROVE 60,000

to plan, design and construct improvements to county road 7 from county road S to county road Q in Curry county

Curry

CURRY CO RD S IMPROVE 90,000

to plan, design and construct improvements to county road S from United States highway 60/84 to county road 7 in 
Curry county

Curry

CURRY CO ROADS CONSTRUCT IMPROVE 930,000

to plan, design and construct improvements to county roads 3, 7, 10, 15, E, P and S in Curry county

Curry

SUGAR BEET RD/US HWY 60/84 INTRSECT CURRY CO 250,000 Clovis

to plan, design, construct and make improvements to the approach and intersection of Sugar Beet road with United 
States highway 60/84 in Curry county

Curry

ANAPRA RD PLAN/DESIGN PHASE 1 SUNLAND PARK 150,000 Sunland Park

to plan and design phase 1 improvements to Anapra road from McNutt road to the border in Sunland Park in Dona 
Ana county

Dona Ana

BOWMAN ST LAS CRUCES/MESILLA IMPROVE 750,000

to plan, design and construct road, flood control and utility improvements on Bowman street in Las Cruces and 
Mesilla in Dona Ana county

Dona Ana

CALLE DE PARIAN IMPROVE MESILLA 897,396 Mesilla

to plan, design and construct improvements on calle de Parian in Mesilla in Dona Ana county

Dona Ana

CALLE DE PICACHO IMPROVE PH 3 MESILLA 50,000 Mesilla

to plan, design and construct phase 3 improvements to calle de Picacho, including storm drain, utility, water and 
sewer improvements, in Mesilla in Dona Ana county

Dona Ana

CALLE PRIMERA IMPROVE PHASE 1 MESILLA 175,000 Mesilla

to plan, design and construct phase 1 improvements to calle Primera in Mesilla in Dona Ana county

Dona Ana

CALLE SANTA ANA/PARQUE DE LOS LEONES MESILLA 220,000 Mesilla

to plan, design, construct and make improvements, including curbs, drainage, parking, utilities and manhole 
adjustments, to calle Santa Ana and parque de los Leones de Mesilla in Mesilla in Dona Ana county

Dona Ana

DONA ANA CO INTRNATL JETPORT CROSSWIND RUNWAY PH 1 350,000 Santa Teresa

to acquire rights of way and to plan, design and construct phase 1 of a crosswind runway at the county international 
jetport in Dona Ana county

Dona Ana

DONA ANA CO ORGAN MESA RANCH ROADS IMPROVE 151,931

to plan, design and construct improvements to roads in the Organ Mesa Ranch subdivision in Dona Ana county

Dona Ana

DONA ANA CO ORGAN ROADS CONSTRUCT 483,840 Organ

to plan, design, construct and improve roads in Organ in Dona Ana county

Dona Ana

KIT CARSON RD IMPROVE DONA ANA CO 300,000

to acquire rights of way and to plan, design and construct improvements to Kit Carson road in Dona Ana county

Dona Ana

SUNLAND PARK DRAINAGE IMPROVE 75,000 Sunland Park

to plan and design drainage improvements in Sunland Park in Dona Ana county

Dona Ana
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TELSHOR BLVD & SPRUCE AVE IMPROVE LAS CRUCES 260,000 Las Cruces

to acquire rights of way and to plan, design and construct traffic flow improvements to the intersection of Telshor 
boulevard and Spruce avenue in Las Cruces in Dona Ana county

Dona Ana

VADO SAL SI PUEDES NBRHD CORRIDOR 125,000 Vado

to plan, design and construct an access corridor for the Sal Si Puedes neighborhood in Vado in Dona Ana county

Dona Ana

VIA NORTE DRAINAGE STRUCTURE DONA ANA CO 77,000

to plan, design and construct drainage improvements along via Norte in Dona Ana county

Dona Ana

2ND ST IMPROVE LOVING 804,652 Loving

to plan, design and construct improvements, including street repairs, curbs and gutters, to Second street in Loving 
in Eddy county

Eddy

6TH ST IMPROVE LOVING 420,669 Loving

to plan, design and construct improvements, including sidewalks, drive pads, gutters and curbs, to south Sixth 
street in Loving in Eddy county

Eddy

CARTER ROAD IMPROVE RELIEF RT CARLSBAD 250,000

to acquire rights of way and to plan, design, construct, replace, widen and improve Carter road between New 
Mexico highway 31 and United States highway 285, and to acquire rights of way and to plan, design and construct a 
road from the intersection of United States highway 62/180 south-southwest to Refinery road, as part of a relief 
route around Carlsbad between United States highways 285 and 62/180 in Eddy county

Eddy

POPLAR ST IMPROVE LOVING 490,319 Loving

to plan, design and construct improvements, including road repairs, sidewalks, drive pads and curbs, to Poplar 
street in Loving in Eddy county

Eddy

REFINERY ROAD IMPROVE RELIEF RT CARLSBAD 290,000

to acquire rights of way and to plan, design, construct, replace, widen and improve Refinery road, north from its 
intersection with New Mexico highway 31, as part of a relief route around Carlsbad between United States highways 
285 and 62/180 in Eddy county

Eddy

BAYARD ST SIDEWALKS/LIGHTING SANTA CLARA IMPROVE 200,000 Santa Clara

to plan, design, construct, equip and furnish Bayard street sidewalks and lighting improvements in Santa Clara in 
Grant county

Grant

SILVER CITY SIDEWALKS 125,000 Silver City

to plan, design and construct sidewalks in Silver City in Grant county

Grant

MOUNTAIN VIEW RD & 5TH ST LORDSBURG IMPROVE 500,000 Lordsburg

to plan, design and construct street and drainage improvements on Mountain View road and on Fifth street in 
Lordsburg in Hidalgo county

Hidalgo

LEA CO RGNL AIRPORT EXPAND 3,870,000 Hobbs

to plan, design, construct and equip an expansion to the passenger terminal at the Lea county regional airport in 
Hobbs in Lea county

Lea

N COMMERCIAL ST BYPASS CONSTRUCT LOVINGTON 2,958,912 Lovington

to plan, design, construct and make improvements to the north Commercial street bypass in Lovington in Lea 
County

Lea

LINCOLN CO ROADS IMPROVE 500,000

to plan, design and construct road and drainage improvements to roads in Lincoln county

Lincoln

RUIDOSO DOWNS DRAINAGE SYS RUIDOSO GARDENS IMPROVE 282,000 Ruidoso Downs

to acquire easements and to plan, design and construct drainage improvements on Joe Welch drive, Highlands 
lane and North lane in the Ruidoso Gardens subdivision in Ruidoso Downs in Lincoln county

Lincoln

DEMING ROADS 300,000

to plan, design, construct and repair roads in Deming in Luna county

Luna

DEMING STREETS AND DRAINAGE IMPROVE 250,000 Deming

to design and construct street and drainage improvements in Deming in Luna county

Luna
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ALLISON CORRIDOR BYPASS ROUTE IMPROVE GALLUP 505,000 Gallup

to acquire rights of way for and to plan, design, construct and improve the Allison corridor bypass between New 
Mexico highway 118 and New Mexico highway 491 in Gallup in McKinley county

McKinley

COAL AVE ALLEY IMPROVE GALLUP 235,000 Gallup

to plan, design and construct improvements to the Coal avenue alley in Gallup in McKinley county

McKinley

COAL AVE IMPROVE GALLUP 400,000 Gallup

to design and construct improvements to Coal avenue, including sidewalks, drainage and other improvements, in 
Gallup in McKinley county

McKinley

DEER SPRINGS RD IMPROVE MEXICAN SPRINGS CHP 500,000 Mexican Springs Chapt

to plan, design and construct improvements to the Deer Springs road in the Mexican Springs chapter of the Navajo 
Nation in McKinley county

McKinley

HUNTERS POINT ROAD IMPROVE TSAYATOH CHP 114,000 Tsa-Ya-Toh Chapter

to plan, design and construct improvements to Hunters Point road in the Tsayatoh chapter of the Navajo Nation in 
McKinley county

McKinley

MANUELITO CHP SKY CITY ROADS 125,000 Manuelito Chapter

to plan, design and construct phase 1 of Sky City roads project in the Manuelito chapter of the Navajo Nation in 
McKinley county

McKinley

MCKINLEY CO BRIDGES IMPROVE 300,000

to plan, design, construct and make improvements to bridges in McKinley county

McKinley

MCKINLEY CO RD 19 CONSTRUCT IMPROVE 3,700,000

to construct and improve county road 19 in the area of the Casamero Lake, Littlewater and Whitehorse chapters of 
the Navajo Nation in McKinley county

McKinley

NM HWY 118 SAFETY IMPROVEMENTS PH 1 400,000

to acquire rights of way and to plan, design and construct phase 1 safety improvements, including lighting and 
striping, along New Mexico highway 118 from Rehoboth drive to New Mexico highway 566 in accordance with the 
2016 road safety audit findings for that highway in and near Church Rock in McKinley county

McKinley

OLD ZUNI RD & BRIDGE IMPROVE GALLUP 391,000 Gallup

to plan, design and construct improvements to Old Zuni road and bridge in Gallup in McKinley county

McKinley

SUNDANCE RD IMPROVE CHURCH ROCK CHP 1,000,000 Church Rock Chapter

to plan, design and construct road, drainage and bridge improvements to Sundance road in the Church Rock 
chapter of the Navajo Nation in McKinley county

McKinley

SUPERMAN CANYON/NM HWY 118 CONNECTOR MCKINLEY CO 500,000 Gallup

to plan, design and construct a connecting bridge or underpass between Superman Canyon road and New Mexico 
highway 118 in McKinley county

McKinley

NM HWY 347 IMPROVE BERNALILLO & SANDOVAL CO 6,500,000

to acquire rights of way and to plan, design, construct and make improvements to  New Mexico highway 347 in 
Bernalillo and Sandoval counties

Multiple Co

PUEBLO PINTADO CHP ROADS IMPROVE 4,300,000 Pueblo Pintado Chapter

to plan, design and construct improvements to dirt roads in the Pueblo Pintado chapter of the Navajo Nation in San 
Juan and McKinley counties

Multiple Co

ROCK SPRINGS CHP ROADS IMPROVE 500,000 Rock Springs Chapter

to plan, design and construct road and drainage improvements in the Rock Springs chapter of the Navajo Nation in 
McKinley county

Multiple Co

ALAMOGORDO ADA COMPLIANT CORRIDORS 300,000 Alamogordo

to plan, design and construct corridors compliant with the Americans with Disabilities Act of 1990, including curb 
and gutter, ramps, sidewalks and transit and public facilities access improvements, in Alamogordo in Otero county

Otero

FLORIDA AVENUE IMPROVEMENTS OTERO CO 488,000

to plan, design and construct improvements to Florida avenue in Otero county

Otero
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2ND STREET TUCUMCARI 250,000 Tucumcari

to plan, design, construct and make improvements to sidewalks, ramps and road surfacing on Second street in 
Tucumcari in Quay county

Quay

MAPLE ST IMPROVE CHAMA 200,000 Chama

to plan, design and construct road and drainage improvements to Maple street in Chama in Rio Arriba county

Rio Arriba

N MCCURDY ROAD ESPANOLA IMPROVE 210,000 Española

to plan, design and construct improvements, including widening, to north McCurdy road in Espanola in Rio Arriba 
county

Rio Arriba

ROOSEVELT CO ROADS 870,000

to plan, design and construct improvements to county roads in Roosevelt county

Roosevelt

FOOTHILLS DR IMPROVE FARMINGTON 2,575,000 Farmington

to acquire rights of way for and plan, design and construct improvements to Foothills drive, including lanes, a 
roundabout, bicycle lanes and an accessible pedestrian path, in Farmington in San Juan county

San Juan

MAIN ST IMPROVE FARMINGTON 5,000,000 Farmington

to acquire rights of way for and plan, design and construct improvements to lanes, sidewalks, curbs, gutters, 
drainage and intersections, including the addition of roundabouts and parking, on Main street in Farmington in San 
Juan county

San Juan

N5113 IMPROVE PHASE 1 BECLABITO CHP 2,900,000 Beclabito Chapter

to plan, design and construct phase 1 improvements to Navajo route 5113 in the Beclabito chapter of the Navajo 
Nation in San Juan county

San Juan

NAVAJO ROUTE 366 BUS ROUTE IMPROVE 369,954 Fruitland

to plan, design and construct improvements for a school bus route on Navajo route 366 in the San Juan chapter of 
the Navajo Nation in San Juan county

San Juan

NR 5081 IMPROVE T'IISTOH SIKAAD CHP 2,000,000 T'iistoh Sikaad Chapter

to plan, design and construct road and drainage improvements on Navajo route 5081 in the T'iistoh Sikaad chapter 
of the Navajo Nation in San Juan county

San Juan

PINON HILLS BLVD EXTENSION FARMINGTON 22,372,376 Farmington

to plan, design and construct a bridge and extension of Pinon Hills boulevard in Farmington in San Juan county

San Juan

SAN JUAN CHP BUS ROUTES IMPROVE 1,680,000 San Juan Chapter

to plan, design and construct road and drainage improvements to school bus routes in the San Juan chapter of the 
Navajo Nation in San Juan county

San Juan

SAN JUAN CHP HOGBACK BRIDGE 11,180,000 San Juan Chapter

to acquire rights of way for and plan, design and construct the Hogback bridge over the San Juan river in the San 
Juan chapter of the Navajo Nation in San Juan county

San Juan

US HWY 491 & INDIAN SVC ROAD 34 INTRSECT IMPROVE 85,000 Sanostee Chapter

to plan, design and construct improvements at the intersection of United States highway 491 and Indian service 
road 34 in the Sanostee chapter of the Navajo Nation in San Juan county

San Juan

SAN MIGUEL CO RD B28A IMPROVE 1,000,000

to plan, design and construct road and drainage improvements to county road B28A/El Cerrito road in San Miguel 
county

San Miguel

SAN MIGUEL CO ROAD & DRAINAGE IMPROVE/REPAIR 500,000

to plan, design and construct road and drainage improvements and repairs to county roads in San Miguel county

San Miguel

CORRALES ROADS DRAINAGE FEMA MATCH 35,000 Corrales

to match federal emergency management agency grants to design and construct road drainage infrastructure and 
improvements in Corrales in Sandoval county

Sandoval

NM 428 INTERSECTIONS SAFETY SIGNAGE CORRALES 25,000 Corrales

to purchase and install federally mandated safety signage at road intersections on New Mexico highway 428 in 
Corrales in Sandoval county

Sandoval
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PASEO DEL VOLCAN IMPROVE SANDOVAL CO 1,000,000

to acquire rights of way on paseo del Volcan from Unser boulevard to the Bernalillo county line in Sandoval county

Sandoval

AGUA FRIA/S MEADOWS RD IMPROVE SANTA FE 375,000 Santa Fe

to purchase rights of way and to plan, design and construct road improvements at the intersection of Agua Fria 
street and South Meadows road in Santa Fe in Santa Fe county

Santa Fe

JADE LOOP/NAMBE LOOP IMPROVE ELEPHANT BUTTE 268,740 Elephant Butte

to plan, design and construct street and drainage improvements to Jade loop and Nambe loop in Elephant Butte in 
Sierra county

Sierra

SIERRA CO ROADS IMPROVE 500,000

to acquire rights of way and to plan, design and construct renovations and repairs to county roads, including Upham 
road, in Sierra county

Sierra

SOCORRO STREETS REPAIR & IMPROVE 500,000 Socorro

to plan, design, construct, repair, replace and improve streets in Socorro in Socorro county

Socorro

US HWY 60 TURNING LANE SOCORRO CONSTRUCT 5,450,000 Socorro

to plan, design and construct a turning lane on United States highway sixty in Socorro in Socorro county

Socorro

CABRESTO RD & QUESTA ROADS IMPROVE 225,000 Questa

to plan, design, construct and make improvements to roads, including Cabresto road, in Questa in Taos county

Taos

CAMINO DEL MEDIO TAOS CO REPAIR IMPROVE 1,500,000

to acquire rights of way and to plan, design, construct and make repairs, including drainage improvements, to 
camino del Medio in Taos county

Taos

QUESTA BRIDGE SIDEWALK & ROAD IMPROVE 200,000 Questa

to plan, design, construct and make improvements to bridges, sidewalks, roads, curbs and gutters in Questa in 
Taos county

Taos

ALAN AYERS RD PHASE 2 IMPROVE ESTANCIA 100,000 Estancia

to plan, design and construct phase 2 improvements to Alan Ayers road in Estancia in Torrance county

Torrance

CLAYTON MUNICIPAL AIRPORT FUEL TANK REMOVE 57,500 Clayton

to plan, design, demolish and dispose of out-of-service aviation fuel tanks and construct and restore the site at the 
Clayton municipal airport in Clayton in Union county

Union

CAMELOT BLVD IMPROVE LOS LUNAS 450,000 Los Lunas

to design and construct improvements to Camelot boulevard, including replacing pavement, curbs, gutters, 
sidewalks and striping, in Los Lunas in Valencia county

Valencia

MORRIS RD EXTENSION & INTERCHANGE VALENCIA CO 250,000 Los Lunas

to plan, design and construct an extension and interchange at interstate 25 and Morris road south of New Mexico 
highway 6 in Valencia county

Valencia

PERALTA STREET IMPROVEMENTS 170,000 Peralta

to plan, design and construct street improvements in Peralta in Valencia county

Valencia

Agency: PUBLIC SAFETY, DEPARTMENT OF

BERN CO SHERIFF'S DEPT VEHICLES PRCHS EQUIP 1,000,000

to purchase and equip vehicles for the sheriff's department in Bernalillo county

Bernalillo

Agency: ENERGY, MINERALS AND NATURAL RESOURCES DEPARTMENT

CAPITAN DEPOT MUSEUM 75,000 Capitan

to plan, design, purchase, construct and install improvements to convert the Capitan depot to a local museum, 
including a community room, in Capitan in Lincoln county

Lincoln
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LAS VEGAS WATERSHED IMPROVE/RESTORE 1,000,000 Las Vegas

to plan, design and construct watershed restoration and wildfire protection improvements, including forest thinning, 
in the Las Vegas area watershed in San Miguel county

San Miguel

Agency: EASTERN NEW MEXICO UNIVERSITY

ENMU-ROSWELL MOWER PURCH 21,435 Roswell

to purchase and equip a riding mower with accessories for the physical plant department at the Roswell branch 
campus of eastern New Mexico university in Chaves county

Chaves

ENMU-ROSWELL PHYSICAL PLANT DEPT VEHICLE PURCH 41,058 Roswell

to purchase and equip vehicles for the physical plant department at the Roswell branch campus of eastern New 
Mexico university in Chaves county

Chaves

ENMU-ROSWELL SECURITY DEPT VEHICLE PURCH 63,095 Roswell

to purchase and equip vehicles for the campus security department at the Roswell branch campus of eastern New 
Mexico university in Chaves county

Chaves

ENMU-PORTALES INFO TECH IMPROVE 250,000 Portales

to plan, purchase, equip and install information technology upgrades, including related equipment, furniture and 
infrastructure, at eastern New Mexico university in Portales in Roosevelt county

Roosevelt

Agency: HIGHER EDUCATION DEPARTMENT

LCC-SANTA ROSA BUILDING CONSTRUCT 300,000 Santa Rosa

to construct and equip the Brown vocational building on the Santa Rosa satellite campus of Luna community 
college in Santa Rosa in Guadalupe county

Guadalupe

NMJC ALLIED HEALTH BLDG EQUIP HOBBS 500,000 Hobbs

to purchase equipment for the allied health program and to plan, design and construct an allied health building on 
the campus of New Mexico junior college in Hobbs in Lea county

Lea

NAVAJO TECH UNIV SCIENCE/TECH/TRADES BLDGS 232,000 Crownpoint

to plan, design, construct and repair the science, technology and trades buildings at Navajo technical university in 
Crownpoint in the Navajo Nation in McKinley county

McKinley

MCC FARM TRACTOR PURCHASE 25,000 Tucumcari

to purchase and equip a farm tractor for Mesalands community college in Tucumcari in Quay county

Quay

LCC MAINTENANCE DEPT VEHICLES PURCHASE 250,000 Las Vegas

to purchase and equip vehicles for the maintenance department of Luna community college in Las Vegas in San 
Miguel county

San Miguel

LCC MOTOR POOL VEHICLES PURCHASE 100,000 Las Vegas

to purchase and equip vehicles for the motor pool of Luna community college in Las Vegas in San Miguel county

San Miguel

LCC ROADS & PARKING LOTS IMPROVE 500,000 Las Vegas

to plan, repair and improve roads and parking lots at Luna community college in Las Vegas in San Miguel county

San Miguel

LCC ROOFS IMPROVE 300,000 Las Vegas

to plan, design, repair and replace building roofs on the Luna community college campus in Las Vegas in San 
Miguel county

San Miguel

Agency: INDIAN AFFAIRS DEPARTMENT

ACOMA PUEBLO BASEBALL FIELDS CONSTRUCT 300,000 Acoma Pueblo

to plan, design, construct, furnish and equip baseball fields in the Pueblo of Acoma in Cibola county

Cibola

ACOMA PUEBLO MAINSTREET PROGRAM 300,000 Acoma Pueblo

to plan and acquire rights of way for mainstreet program improvements in the Pueblo of Acoma in Cibola county

Cibola
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ACOMA PUEBLO NATURAL GAS DISTRIB 5,726,000 Acoma Pueblo

to acquire easements and rights of way for and to plan, design and construct a natural gas distribution system in 
the Pueblo of Acoma in Cibola county

Cibola

ACOMA PUEBLO VETERANS CTR PARKING LOT IMPROVE 150,000 Acoma Pueblo

to plan, design and construct improvements to the parking lot at the veterans center in the Pueblo of Acoma in 
Cibola county

Cibola

LAGUNA PUEBLO FIRE STATION 1 CONSTRUCT 100,000 Laguna Pueblo

to design and construct fire station one in Casa Blanca in the Pueblo of Laguna in Cibola county

Cibola

LAGUNA PUEBLO FIRE STATION 2 CONSTRUCT 100,000 Laguna Pueblo

to plan, design and construct an expansion for fire station two in Laguna in the Pueblo of Laguna in Cibola county

Cibola

LAGUNA PUEBLO PUBLIC TRANSIT OFFICE BLDG CONSTRUCT 100,000 Laguna Pueblo

to plan, design and construct an expanded building for the public transit office in the Pueblo of Laguna in Cibola 
county

Cibola

RAMAH CHP CHAPTER HOUSE & PLANNED COMMUNITY 2,400,000 Ramah Chapter

to acquire easements and rights of way and to plan, design, construct and equip a chapter house and planned 
community, including infrastructure, housing and community and government service centers, in Section 21 of the 
Ramah chapter of the Navajo Nation in Cibola county

Cibola

RAMAH CHP LIVESTOCK TRAINING FCLTY CONSTRUCT/EQUIP 1,200,000 Ramah Chapter

to design, construct, purchase, install, furnish and equip the interior of the chapter's livestock training facility, 
including furniture, equipment, information technology and related infrastructure, in the Ramah chapter of the 
Navajo Nation in Cibola county

Cibola

RAMAH CHP SOLID WASTE TRANSFER STATION 350,000 Ramah Chapter

to plan, design, purchase, construct, equip and install a solid waste transfer station, including a trash compactor 
dumpster, a trash bin and an operator building, in the Ramah chapter of the Navajo Nation in Cibola county

Cibola

RAMAH CHP WELLS 2,750,000 Ramah Chapter

to plan, design, drill, construct, equip and install water wells at the Ramah detention center and in Section 27 of the 
Ramah chapter of the Navajo Nation in Cibola county

Cibola

RAMAH CHP WWATER SYSTEM CONSTRUCT 1,700,000 Ramah Chapter

to acquire land, easements and rights of way and to plan, design and construct a  wastewater system, including 
sewer line and lined lagoon, in the Mountain View area of the Ramah chapter of the Navajo Nation in Cibola county

Cibola

ASHIWI COLLEGE ROOF REPAIR ZUNI 275,000 Zuni Pueblo

to plan, design and construct roof repairs at Ashiwi college and career center in the Pueblo of Zuni in McKinley 
county

McKinley

BAAHAALI CHP CHAPTER HOUSE IMPROVE 300,000 Baahaali Chapter

to plan, design, construct, equip and improve the chapter house in the Baahaali chapter of the Navajo Nation in 
McKinley county

McKinley

BAAHAALI CHP POWERLINE EXTEND & WIRING 300,000 Baahaali Chapter

to plan, design, construct and equip power line extensions and house wiring in the Baahaali chapter of the Navajo 
Nation in McKinley county

McKinley

BAAHAALI CHP SOLID WASTE CTR HEAVY EQUIP/TRASH BIN 75,000 Baahaali Chapter

to purchase, equip and install heavy equipment and trash bins for the solid waste collection and recycling center in 
the Baahaali chapter of the Navajo Nation in McKinley county

McKinley

BACA/PREWITT CHP BACKHOE & GRADER PURCHASE 90,000 Baca Chapter

to purchase heavy equipment, including a backhoe and road grader, in the Baca/Prewitt chapter of the Navajo 
Nation in McKinley county

McKinley

CHICHILTAH CHP BATHRM ADD 200,000 Chichiltah Chapter

to plan, design, construct and equip bathroom additions, including fixtures and wiring, in the Chichiltah chapter of 
the Navajo Nation in McKinley county

McKinley

Thursday, February 16, 2017 Page 17 of 51Projects Requested by Agency w Purpose 2



Capital Outlay Projects

List of Requested Projects by Agency

Project Title Total Project Cost

Legislative Council Service

       City

53rd Legislature, 1st Session, 2017

County

CHICHILTAH CHP SEWER LAGOON 500,000 Chichiltah Chapter

to plan, design, construct and improve a sewer lagoon in the Chichiltah chapter of the Navajo Nation in McKinley 
county

McKinley

COYOTE CANYON CHP DUMP TRUCK PURCHASE 160,000 Coyote Canyon Chapte

to purchase and equip a dump truck for the Coyote Canyon chapter of the Navajo Nation in McKinley county

McKinley

COYOTE CANYON CHP TRACTOR PURCHASE 70,000 Coyote Canyon Chapte

to purchase and equip a farm tractor for the Coyote Canyon chapter of the Navajo Nation in McKinley county

McKinley

COYOTE CANYON CHP TRUCK PURCHASE 80,000 Coyote Canyon Chapte

to purchase and equip a work truck for the Coyote Canyon chapter of the Navajo Nation in McKinley county

McKinley

COYOTE CANYON CHP VAN PURCHASE 85,000 Coyote Canyon Chapte

to purchase and equip a wheelchair accessible van for the Coyote Canyon chapter of the Navajo Nation in McKinley 
county

McKinley

CROWNPOINT NAVAJO VETERANS BLDG CONSTRUCT 100,000 Crownpoint

to plan, design and construct a building for Navajo veterans in Crownpoint in McKinley county

McKinley

GALLUP INTERTRIBAL CEREMONIAL OFFICE EQUIP FURNISH 50,000 Gallup

to purchase and install equipment and furnishings, including display cases, in the intertribal ceremonial office in 
Gallup in McKinley county

McKinley

NATL NAVAJO CODE TALKERS MUSEUM TSAYATOH CHP 1,000,000 Tsa-Ya-Toh Chapter

to plan, design and construct a national Navajo code talkers museum and veterans center in Tse Bonito in the 
Tsayatoh chapter of the Navajo Nation in McKinley county

McKinley

PUEBLO PINTADO CHP POWER LINE EXTENSION 50,000 Pueblo Pintado Chapter

to plan, design, construct and equip power line extensions and house wiring in the Pueblo Pintado chapter of the 
Navajo Nation in McKinley county

McKinley

RED LAKE CHP NAVAJO UTILITY LINES IMPROVE 50,000 Red Lake Chapter

to plan, design and construct improvements to water, wastewater, natural gas and electric lines in Navajo in the 
Red Lake chapter of the Navajo Nation in McKinley county

McKinley

THOREAU CHP VETERANS SERVICE CTR CONSTRUCT 300,000 Thoreau Chapter

to plan, design and construct a veterans service center in the Thoreau chapter of the Navajo Nation in McKinley 
county

McKinley

TOHATCHI CHP WHISKEY LAKE POWER LINE 510,000 Tohatchi Chapter

to plan, design and construct a power line in the Whiskey lake area of the Tohatchi chapter of the Navajo Nation in 
McKinley county

McKinley

TSE'II'AHI' CHP HEADSTART BLDG CONSTRUCT 3,600,000 Tse'ii'ahi Chapter

to construct, equip and furnish a headstart facility in the Tse'ii'ahi' (Standing Rock) chapter of the Navajo Nation

McKinley

TSE'LICHII/ REDROCK CHP VEHICLE PURCHASE 50,000 Red Rock Chapter

to purchase and equip a vehicle for the Tse'Lichii/Red Rock chapter of the Navajo Nation in McKinley county

McKinley

ZUNI CDA WWATER LAGOON CONSTRUCT 651,908 Zuni Pueblo

to plan, design and construct a wastewater lagoon for the commercial development area in the Pueblo of Zuni in 
McKinley county

McKinley

ZUNI WATER SYSTEM GENERATOR PURCH & EQUIP 352,000 Zuni Pueblo

to plan, design, construct, purchase and equip a generator, including concrete pad and stand, to power the main 
water well in the Pueblo of Zuni in McKinley county

McKinley

ROCK SPRINGS CHP MULTIPURPOSE CENTER CONSTRUCT 500,000 Rock Springs Chapter

to plan, design, construct, furnish and equip a multipurpose center in the Rock Springs chapter of the Navajo Nation 
in McKinley county

Multiple Co

SANDIA PUEBLO COMPUTER-AIDED EMERGENCY DISPATCH 150,115 Sandia Pueblo

to purchase and install equipment for a computer-aided emergency dispatch center with 911 capabilities at the 
Pueblo of Sandia in Bernalillo and Sandoval counties

Multiple Co
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TORREON/STAR LAKE CHP HOUSE CONSTRUCT 200,000 Torreon-Star Lake Cha

to plan, design and construct a chapter house at the Torreon/Star Lake chapter of the Navajo Nation in Sandoval 
county

Multiple Co

GALLERITO FLATS SEWER & WATER SYSTEM MESCALERO 150,000

to plan, design and construct a sewer system and a water system for the Gallerito Flats neighborhood of the 
Mescalero Apache Tribe in Otero county

Otero

MESCALERO FIRE SUBSTATION CONSTRUCT 75,000

to plan, design and construct a fire and rescue substation for the Mescalero Apache Tribe in Mescalero in Otero 
county

Otero

MESCALERO SEWER & WATER SYSTEM/OLD ROAD 150,000

to plan, design and construct a sewer and water system for the Old Road neighborhood of the Mescalero Apache 
Tribe in Otero county

Otero

JICARILLA APACHE COMM TOWER CONSTRUCT 180,000

to plan, design, construct and equip a communications tower for the Jicarilla Apache Nation in Rio Arriba county

Rio Arriba

OHKAY OWINGEH REG OUTDOOR RECREATION FCLTY 2,840,236 Ohkay Owingeh

to construct and equip a regional outdoor recreation facility at Ohkay Owingeh in Rio Arriba county

Rio Arriba

SANTA CLARA PUEBLO CMTY HEALTH PRGM OFFICE REN 50,000 Santa Clara Pueblo

to plan, design, construct, renovate and repair a facility for a community health representative program at the 
Pueblo of Santa Clara in Rio Arriba county

Rio Arriba

SANTA CLARA PUEBLO REGIONAL HEALTH CENTER 100,000 Santa Clara Pueblo

to plan, design, construct, furnish and equip a regional health center for the Pueblo of Santa Clara in Rio Arriba 
county

Rio Arriba

GADII'AHI/TO'KOI CHP MULTIPURPOSE BLDG CONSTRUCT 2,000,000 Gadii'ahi Chapter

to plan, design, construct, equip and install a multipurpose building, including infrastructure, a meeting room and a 
senior center, in the Gadii'ahi/To'koi chapter of the Navajo Nation in San Juan county

San Juan

LAKE VALLEY CHP OWL SPRING WATER LINE/BATHRM ADDS 500,000 Lake Valley Chapter

to plan, design and construct bathroom additions and for an extension of the Owl Spring waterline in the area north 
of the Lake Valley chapter of the Navajo Nation in San Juan county

San Juan

LAKE VALLEY CHP YELLOW POINT ROCK POWERLINE EXTEND 600,000 Lake Valley Chapter

to plan, design and construct the Yellow Point rock powerline extension east of the the Lake Valley chapter of the 
Navajo Nation in San Juan county

San Juan

RED VALLEY CHP POWER LINE EXTENSION 200,000 Red Valley Chapter

to plan, design and construct power line extensions in the Red Valley chapter of the Navajo Nation in San Juan 
county

San Juan

SAN JUAN CHP PARKING LOT LIGHTS 236,000 Fruitland

to plan, design and construct parking lot lights for a multipurpose building in Fruitland in the San Juan chapter of 
the Navajo Nation in San Juan county

San Juan

SHEEP SPRINGS CHP BATHROOM ADDITIONS 65,000 Sheepsprings Chapter

to plan, design, construct, purchase and install bathroom additions in the Sheep Springs chapter of the Navajo 
Nation in San Juan county

San Juan

SHIPROCK CHP EXCAVATOR PRCHS EQUIP 448,808 Shiprock Chapter

to purchase and equip an excavator for the department of water resources in the Shiprock chapter of the Navajo 
Nation in San Juan county

San Juan

T'IISTOH SIKAAD CHP MULTIPURPOSE BLDG 150,000 T'iistoh Sikaad Chapter

to plan, design and construct a multipurpose building in the T'iistoh Sikaad chapter of the Navajo Nation in San 
Juan county

San Juan

T'IISTOH SIKAAD CHP POWER LINE CONSTRUCT 500,000 T'iistoh Sikaad Chapter

to acquire rights of way for and plan, design and construct power line extensions in the T'iistoh Sikaad chapter of 
the Navajo Nation in San Juan county

San Juan
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T'IISTOH SIKAAD CHP VETERANS MEM MLTPRPS CMPLX 1,500,000 T'iistoh Sikaad Chapter

to plan, design, construct, furnish and equip a veterans memorial multipurpose complex in the T'iistoh Sikaad 
chapter of the Navajo Nation in San Juan county

San Juan

T'IISTOH SIKAAD CHP WATER SYSTEM CONSTRUCT 3,900,249 T'iistoh Sikaad Chapter

to acquire rights of way for and plan, design and construct water line extensions in the T'iistoh Sikaad chapter of the 
Navajo Nation in San Juan county

San Juan

TOOH HALTSOOI CHP MULTIPURPOSE BLDG 3,200,000 Tooh Haltsooi Chapter

to construct and furnish phase 2 of the multipurpose building in the Tooh Haltsooi chapter of the Navajo Nation in 
San Juan county

San Juan

TOOH HALTSOOI CHP SOLAR SYSTEMS 310,000

to plan, design and construct solar systems to provide electricity to homes in the Tooh Haltsooi chapter of the 
Navajo Nation in San Juan county

San Juan

TOOH HALTSOOI MOTOR GRADER PRCHS EQUIP 305,000 Tooh Haltsooi Chapter

to purchase and equip a motor grader for the Tooh Haltsooi chapter of the Navajo Nation in San Juan county

San Juan

TSE'DAA'KAAN CHP ROAD GRADER PURCHASE 100,000 Tse'Daa'Kaan Chapter

to purchase and equip a road grader in the Tse'Daa'Kaan chapter of the Navajo Nation in San Juan county

San Juan

TSE'DAA'KAAN VETERANS' WELLNESS CENTER CONSTRUCT 75,000 Tse'Daa'Kaan Chapter

to plan, design and construct a veterans' wellness center in the Tse'Daa'Kaan chapter of the Navajo Nation in San 
Juan county

San Juan

WHITE ROCK CHP MULTIPURPOSE BLDG IMPROVE 859,477 White Rock Chapter

to plan, design, renovate and equip the multipurpose community building, including hazardous materials abatement 
and electrical upgrades, for the White Rock chapter of the Navajo Nation in San Juan county

San Juan

JEMEZ PUEBLO POWER & WATERLINE EXTEND 250,000 Jemez Pueblo

to plan, design and construct extensions to the power and waterlines in the Pueblo of Jemez in Sandoval county

Sandoval

SANTA ANA PUEBLO PUBLIC BLDG COMPLEX CONSTRUCT 500,000 Santa Ana Pueblo

to plan, design and construct a public safety, judicial and social service complex at the Pueblo of Santa Ana in 
Sandoval county

Sandoval

SANTA ANA PUEBLO SCADA SYSTEM 845,000 Santa Ana Pueblo

to plan, design, construct and equip a water storage tank with a supervisory control and data acquisition system 
and related appurtenances for the Pueblo of Santa Ana in Sandoval county

Sandoval

SANTA ANA PUEBLO WELL HOUSE & ARSENIC REMOVAL SYS 1,920,000 Santa Ana Pueblo

to plan, design, construct and equip a well house with an arsenic removal system and a supervisory control and 
data acquisition system for well 5 on the Pueblo of Santa Ana in Sandoval county

Sandoval

SANTO DOMINGO PUEBLO EDUCATION BLDG REN 50,000 Santo Domingo Pueblo

to plan, design, construct and renovate an education building at the Pueblo of Santo Domingo in Sandoval county

Sandoval

NAMBE PUEBLO EARLY CHILDHOOD LEARNING FACILITY 1,549,165 Nambe Pueblo

to construct, furnish and equip an early childhood learning facility at the Pueblo of Nambe in Santa Fe county

Santa Fe

POJOAQUE PUEBLO ADMIN BLDG CONSTRUCT FURNISH 1,950,000 Pojoaque Pueblo

to plan, design, construct, equip and furnish a tribal administration building for the Pueblo of Pojoaque in Santa Fe 
county

Santa Fe

POJOAQUE PUEBLO HOUSING PROJECT INFRA IMPROVE 850,000 Pojoaque Pueblo

to plan, design, construct and improve roads, erosion control and other infrastructure for a tribal housing subdivision 
in the Pueblo of Pojoaque in Santa Fe county

Santa Fe

POJOAQUE PUEBLO POEH ED CTR REPAIR 1,500,000 Pojoaque Pueblo

to plan, design, construct, purchase and install improvements at the Poeh education center, including roofing, 
flooring, windows, doors, a security system, heating, ventilation and air conditioning, and to purchase vehicles and 
information technology, including related equipment, furniture and infrastructure, for the Pueblo of Pojoaque in 
Santa Fe county

Santa Fe
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POJOAQUE PUEBLO WELLNESS CTR REPAIR/REN 600,000 Pojoaque Pueblo

to plan, design, equip, renovate and repair and to purchase and equip vehicles for the Pojoaque wellness center in 
the Pueblo of Pojoaque in Santa Fe county

Santa Fe

POJOAQUE PUEBLO WWATER TREATMENT PLANT IMPROVE 1,200,000 Pojoaque Pueblo

to plan, design, construct, improve and equip the wastewater plant and systems for the Pueblo of Pojoaque in 
Santa Fe county

Santa Fe

SAN ILDEFONSO WWATER FCLTY/SYSTEM CONSTRUCT 100,000 San Ildefonso Pueblo

to plan, design, construct, equip and install a wastewater facility and system in the Pueblo of San Ildefonso in Santa 
Fe county

Santa Fe

SFIS ROAD & DRAINAGE IMPROVEMENTS 900,000 Santa Fe

to plan, design and construct an access lane and other road improvements, including ingress and egress, curbs 
and gutters and storm drainage, at the Santa Fe Indian school in Santa Fe in Santa Fe county

Santa Fe

PICURIS PUEBLO ROAD EQUIPMENT 361,000 Picuris Pueblo

to purchase and equip road equipment for the tribal works department of the Pueblo of Picuris in Taos county

Taos

TAOS PUEBLO MOTOR GRADER 118,965 Taos Pueblo

to purchase and equip a motor grader for the road maintenance department in the Pueblo of Taos in Taos county

Taos

Agency: INTERSTATE STREAM COMMISSION

HEREDIA COMMUNITY DITCH IMPROVE GRANT CO 401,487

to plan, design, construct, equip and furnish improvements to the Heredia community ditch in Grant county

Grant

ACEQUIA DE LA SIERRA DE HOLMAN IMPROVE EQUIP 50,000

to plan, design and construct improvements to and to purchase equipment for the acequia de la Sierra de Holman 
in Mora county

Mora

ACEQUIA DE LA JARITA IMPROVE 63,050

to plan, design, construct and improve the acequia de la Jarita for the acequia Jarita ditch association in Rio Arriba 
county

Rio Arriba

ACEQUIA DE OJO SARCO RIO ARRIBA CO 35,000 Ojo Sarco

to plan, design and construct improvements to the acequia de Ojo Sarco, including installing piping, in Rio Arriba 
county

Rio Arriba

LA MADERA DITCH DIVERSION DAM RIO ARRIBA CO 45,000 La Madera

to plan, design and construct a diversion dam in front of the headgate on La Madera ditch in Rio Arriba county

Rio Arriba

BLOOMFIELD IRRIGATION DISTRICT DITCH & EQUIP 2,251,382

to plan, design and construct improvements to the irrigation ditch and to purchase equipment and vehicles for the 
Bloomfield irrigation district in San Juan county

San Juan

ACEQUIA DE LOS SEGURAS IMPROVE SAN MIGUEL CO 87,680

to plan, design and construct improvements to the acequia de Los Seguras in San Miguel county

San Miguel

ACEQUIA DE LOS VECINOS WEST IMPROVE SAN MIGUEL CO 55,000

to plan, design and construct improvements to the acequia de Los Vecinos west in San Miguel county

San Miguel

ACEQUIA MADRE DE LAS VEGAS IMPROVEMENTS 250,000

to plan, design and construct improvements to the acequia madre de Las Vegas in San Miguel county

San Miguel

RIO DE LA VACA ACEQUIA IMPROVE SAN MIGUEL CO 55,400

to plan, design, construct, repair and install improvements to the Rio de la Vaca acequia in San Miguel county

San Miguel

JEMEZ RIVER BASIN ACEQUIA IMPROVE 58,000

to plan, design and construct improvements to the Jemez river basin acequia in Sandoval county

Sandoval

ACEQUIA DE LA COMUNIDAD SANTA FE CO 45,912

to plan, design and construct improvements to the acequia de la Comunidad in Santa Fe county

Santa Fe
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ACEQUIA DE LA OTRA BANDA IMPROVE SANTA FE CO 149,955

to plan, design and construct improvements to the acequia de La Otra Banda in Santa Fe county

Santa Fe

ACEQUIA DE LA OTRA BANDA REPAIR SANTA FE CO 58,000

to plan, design and construct repairs, including a low head weir and concrete work, to the acequia de la Otra Banda 
in Santa Fe county

Santa Fe

ACEQUIA DE LOS BARRIALES IMPROVE SANTA FE CO 16,400 Cundiyo

to plan, design and construct improvements to the acequia de los Barriales in Santa Fe county

Santa Fe

ACEQUIA DE LOS FRESQUEZ IMPROVE SANTA FE CO 177,085

to plan, design, construct and make improvements, including a diversion dam, to the acequia de los Fresquez in 
Santa Fe county

Santa Fe

ACEQUIA DE LOS ROMEROS IMPROVE 63,302

to plan, design and construct a siphon and related improvements to the acequia de los Romeros in Santa Fe county

Santa Fe

ACEQUIA DE MOLINO IMPROVE SANTA FE CO 45,000

to plan, design and construct a diversion dam for the acequia de Molino in Santa Fe county

Santa Fe

ACEQUIA DEL BARRANCO ALTO IMPROVE 73,156

to plan, design and construct improvements to the acequia del Barranco Alto in Santa Fe county

Santa Fe

ACEQUIA DEL BARRANCO DE JACONA IMPROVE 33,000

to plan, design and construct improvements to the acequia del Barranco de Jacona in Santa Fe county

Santa Fe

ACEQUIA DEL CANO IMPROVE SANTA FE CO 91,935

to plan, design and construct improvements to the acequia del Cano in Santa Fe county

Santa Fe

ACEQUIA DEL LLANO/SANTA FE CO RD 84G ROW IMPROVE 20,000 Nambe

to plan, design and construct repairs and improvements, including gabions, to the acequia del Llano and county 
road 84G right of way in the Nambe area in Santa Fe county

Santa Fe

ACEQUIA DEL RINCON IMPROVEMENTS SANTA FE CO 50,000 Pojoaque

to plan, design, construct and install infrastructure improvements, including replacing concrete, installing culverts 
and stabilizing banks and borders, to the acequia del Rincon in Santa Fe county

Santa Fe

LA CIENEGA RESERVOIR IMPROVEMENTS 25,522 La Cienega

to plan, design and construct improvements to La Cienega reservoir for the acequia de La Cienega in Santa Fe 
county

Santa Fe

RIO EN MEDIO DITCH IMPROVE SANTA FE CO 24,825

to plan, design and construct improvements to the Rio en Medio ditch in Santa Fe county

Santa Fe

ACEQUIA DE LA JOYA IMPROVE 1,000,000

to plan, design and construct improvements to the acequia de la Joya in Socorro county

Socorro

ACEQUIA DEL MONTE DEL RIO CHIQUITO EQUIPMENT PRCHS 50,000

to purchase equipment for use in dam restoration and bank stabilization for the acequia del Monte del Rio Chiquito 
and acequia Madre del Rio Chiquito in Taos county

Taos

ACEQUIA DEL MONTE IMPROVE TAOS CO 60,000

to plan, design and construct improvements, including the purchase and installation of pipe and plastic liner, to the 
acequia del Monte del Rio Chiquito in Taos county

Taos

ACEQUIA MADRE DEL RIO GRANDE DEL RANCHO TAOS CO 30,000

to plan, design and construct phase 3 improvements to the venita Teodoro Romero of the acequia Madre del Rio 
Grande del Rancho in Taos county

Taos

REBALSE DITCH IMPROVE TAOS CO 100,000

to plan, design, purchase and construct improvements and equipment, including head gates, a water measuring 
device, maintenance equipment and concrete repair, for the Rebalse ditch in Taos county

Taos

Agency: LOCAL GOVERNMENT DIVISION
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ALB ANDERSON HEIGHTS PARK CONSTRUCT 500,000 Albuquerque

to plan, design, construct and equip Anderson Heights park in Albuquerque in Bernalillo county

Bernalillo

ALB ANDERSON HIGHLANDS PARK IMPROVE 100,000 Albuquerque

to plan, design, purchase, construct and install improvements, including playground and other equipment, to 
Anderson Highlands park in Albuquerque in Bernalillo county

Bernalillo

ALB EXPLORA SCI CTR & CHILDREN'S MUS PH 1B 750,000 Albuquerque

to plan, design and equip phase 1B of Explora's cradle to career learning center and to plan, design, construct, 
purchase and install exhibits, furniture and equipment at the Explora science center and children's museum in 
Albuquerque in Bernalillo county

Bernalillo

ALB FOOD BANK IMPROVE 550,000 Albuquerque

to plan, design, purchase, construct and equip a food bank warehouse, including pre-fabricated walls and ceiling 
panels, compressors, lighting and electrical, doors, bollards, fire suppression and roof and building modifications, in 
Albuquerque in Bernalillo county

Bernalillo

ALB INTERNATIONAL DIST PUBLIC LIBRARY CONSTRUCT 1,300,000 Albuquerque

to acquire rights of way and to plan, design, construct, equip and furnish the International district library in 
Albuquerque in Bernalillo county

Bernalillo

ALB LADERA GOLF COURSE IMPROVE 1,000,000 Albuquerque

to purchase equipment and to plan, design, construct and make site improvements to the Ladera golf course in 
Albuquerque in Bernalillo county

Bernalillo

ALB LOMA LINDA CMTY CTR GYMNASIUM 3,000,000 Albuquerque

to design, construct, equip and furnish the Loma Linda community center gymnasium in Albuquerque in Bernalillo 
county

Bernalillo

ALB LOS ALTOS PARK BMX FACILITY 1,000,000 Albuquerque

to plan, design and construct a bicycle motocross facility in Los Altos park in Albuquerque in Bernalillo county

Bernalillo

ALB N DOMINGO BACA MULTIGEN CTR CONSTRUCT PHASE 3 500,000 Albuquerque

to construct phase 3 improvements to north Domingo Baca multigenerational center, including a gymnasium and 
outdoor amphitheater, in Albuquerque in Bernalillo county

Bernalillo

ALB NW LIBRARY CONSTRUCT 885,000 Albuquerque

to purchase land and to plan, design, construct furnish and equip a library in northwest Albuquerque in Bernalillo 
county

Bernalillo

ALB PAT HURLEY PARK & COMMUNITY CTR IMPROVE 400,000 Albuquerque

to plan, design, construct, expand, renovate, purchase and install improvements to the Pat Hurley park and 
community center in Albuquerque in Bernalillo county

Bernalillo

ALB PETROGLYPH LITTLE LEAGUE FIELDS IMPROVE 40,000 Albuquerque

to plan, design and construct improvements to the Petroglyph little league fields, including a lightning shelter, safety 
railings, backstop extensions, lighting and shade structures, in Albuquerque in Bernalillo county

Bernalillo

ALB ROUTE 66 VISITORS CENTER CONSTRUCT 1,000,000 Albuquerque

to plan, design, purchase, construct, furnish and equip a Route 66 visitors' center on west Central avenue in 
Albuquerque in Bernalillo county

Bernalillo

ALB ZIA LITTLE LEAGUE SECURITY LIGHTS 75,000 Albuquerque

to plan, design, construct, purchase and install pathway and security lights for the city of Albuquerque's Zia little 
league facility in Albuquerque in Bernalillo county

Bernalillo

ALB-BERN CO INTEGRATED LAND MOBILE RADIO SYSTEM 1,000,000

to plan, design, purchase and install an integrated land mobile radio system for public safety responders in 
Albuquerque and in Bernalillo county

Bernalillo

ATRISCO CMTY BICYCLE RECYCLING PROGRAM EQUIP 6,200 Albuquerque

to purchase tools and equipment for a community bicycle recycling program in the Atrisco community and 
southwest area of Albuquerque in Bernalillo county

Bernalillo
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ATRISCO LAND GRANT-MERCED OFFICE BLDG 385,000

to plan, design, purchase, construct and improve an office building for the Town of Atrisco land grant-merced in 
Bernalillo county

Bernalillo

BERN CO ANIMAL CARE SERVICES DEPT VEHICLES PRCHS 840,000

to purchase and equip vehicles, including animal care boxes, for the animal care services department in Bernalillo 
county

Bernalillo

BERN CO ARENAL DRAIN BLUFF AREA PARK 1,000,000

to purchase, plan, design and construct a park and outdoor facilities along the bluff area of the Arenal drain from 
west Central avenue to Bridge street, both within and outside the city limits of Albuquerque in Bernalillo county

Bernalillo

BERN CO FIRE DEPARTMENT CARDIAC MONITORS 341,000

to purchase and equip cardiac monitors for the county fire department in Bernalillo county

Bernalillo

BERN CO LOS PADILLAS COMM CTR EXPAND 150,000

to plan, design, construct and expand facilities, including demolishing existing structures, at Los Padillas community 
center in Bernalillo county

Bernalillo

BERN CO METROPOLITAN COURT BLDG IMPROVE 1,088,380 Albuquerque

to plan, design, construct, furnish and equip improvements to the courthouse, including courtrooms, judges' 
chambers, jury rooms and public and restricted access areas, for the Bernalillo county metropolitan court in 
Albuquerque in Bernalillo county

Bernalillo

BERN CO METROPOLITAN DETENTION CTR FLOORS & DRAINS 150,000 Albuquerque

to plan, design, demolish, purchase, construct and install kitchen floors and drains at the metropolitan detention 
center in Albuquerque in Bernalillo county

Bernalillo

BERN CO METROPOLITAN DETENTION CTR ROOF PHASE 1 800,000 Albuquerque

to plan, design, construct, equip and install phase 1 of a roof replacement at the metropolitan detention center in 
Albuquerque in Bernalillo county

Bernalillo

BERN CO MID-NORTH VALLEY RECREATION CTR PHASE 2 100,000

to plan, design, construct, equip and furnish phase 2 of the mid-north valley recreation center in Bernalillo county

Bernalillo

BERN CO MLTPRPS INDOOR SPORTS FCLTY 500,000

to acquire land for and to plan, design, construct, purchase, renovate, equip and furnish a multipurpose indoor 
sports facility in Bernalillo county

Bernalillo

BERN CO PARADISE HILLS LL FCLTY IMPROVE PH 1 720,000

to plan, design, construct, equip and furnish phase 1 facility improvements, including paving, furnishing, lighting and 
site work in common areas between fields, and to improve the north parking lot for the Paradise Hills little league in 
Bernalillo county

Bernalillo

BERN CO PARADISE HILLS PARK/PARK LANE/CMTY CTR 300,000

to plan, design, construct, equip and install improvements, including parking, bleachers, site work and pedestrian 
improvements, to Paradise Hills park, Park lane and the Paradise Hills community center in Bernalillo county

Bernalillo

BERN CO PUBLIC SAFETY TRAINING FCLTY LAND 600,000

to acquire land for a public safety training facility, helicopter landing pad and hangar for the county fire department 
and sheriff's office in Bernalillo county

Bernalillo

BERN CO S VALLEY MLTPRPS SENIOR CTR BUS PRCHS 62,000

to purchase and equip a wheelchair-accessible bus for the South Valley multipurpose senior center in Bernalillo 
county

Bernalillo

BERN CO SWEDE SCHOLER INDOOR SPORTS FCLTY 500,000

to plan, design and construct an indoor sports facility at the Swede Scholer recreation complex in Bernalillo county

Bernalillo

BERN CO SWEDE SCHOLER IRRIGATION SYS & FIELDS 1,000,000

to plan, design and construct irrigation infrastructure and playing fields at the Swede Scholer recreation complex in 
Bernalillo county

Bernalillo

BERN CO TOM TENORIO PARK IMPROVE 625,725

to plan, design, construct, equip and furnish site improvements, including irrigation and ball fields, to Tom Tenorio 
park in Bernalillo county

Bernalillo
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BERN CO WESTSIDE COMMUNITY CENTER IMPROVE 500,000

to plan, design and construct storm drainage and facility improvements and to expand the parking lot at the 
Westside community center in Bernalillo county

Bernalillo

LOS RANCHOS DE ALB AGRI-NATURE CTR IMPROVE 750,000 Los Ranchos de Albuq

to plan, design and construct building and grounds improvements to the Agri-Nature center in Los Ranchos de 
Albuquerque in Bernalillo county

Bernalillo

SOUTH VALLEY POOL IMPROVE PHASE 2 BERN CO 750,000

to plan, design, construct and equip phase two improvements, including a bathhouse and mechanical room, to the 
South Valley pool in Bernalillo county

Bernalillo

TIJERAS POLICE DEPT VEHICLE PURCHASE 68,250 Tijeras

to purchase and equip vehicles for the police department in Tijeras in Bernalillo county

Bernalillo

TIJERAS PUBLIC WORKS EQUIPMENT MAINT BLDG 150,000 Tijeras

to plan, design and construct a building for storage and maintenance of public works equipment in Tijeras in 
Bernalillo county

Bernalillo

CATRON CO COURTHOUSE RENOVATE 150,000 Reserve

to plan, design, purchase, construct and equip renovations and improvements to the county courthouse in Catron 
county

Catron

CHAVES CO EMERGENCY COM EQUIP IMPROVE 220,000

to plan, design, purchase, construct, install and equip an emergency communications system in Chaves county

Chaves

CHAVES CO SHERIFFS DEPT VEHICLES PURCHASE 210,000

to purchase and equip vehicles for the sheriff's department in Chaves county

Chaves

DEXTER LAKE VAN DOCKS 125,000 Dexter

to plan, design, purchase, construct and install docks on lake Van in Dexter in Chaves county

Chaves

HAGERMAN ANGELL SPORTS COMPLEX WALKING TRACK 200,000 Hagerman

to plan, design and construct a walking track/path at the Angell sports complex in Hagerman in Chaves county

Chaves

LAKE ARTHUR BACKHOE/LOADER PRCHS 250,000 Lake Arthur

to purchase and equip a backhoe/loader, including box blade and snowplow attachments, in Lake Arthur in Chaves 
county

Chaves

ROSWELL AIR CENTER ROOF AND BLDGS REPLACE & REPAIR 3,500,000 Roswell

to plan, design, construct and replace roofs and for structural repairs and replacements on buildings at the Roswell 
international air center in Chaves county

Chaves

ROSWELL FIRE DEPT LADDER TRUCK PURCHASE 1,500,000 Roswell

to purchase and equip an aerial ladder fire truck for the Roswell fire department in Chaves county

Chaves

ROSWELL INTRNATL AIR CENTER ROOF REPLACE 3,500,000 Roswell

to plan, design, install and construct roof and associated structural repair and replacement on buildings at the 
Roswell international air center in Chaves county

Chaves

ROSWELL MCBRIDE VETERANS CEMETERY IMPROVE 210,000 Roswell

to plan, design and construct improvements, including fencing, lighting and electrical, an awning and site work, to 
the McBride veterans memorial cemetery in Roswell in Chaves county

Chaves

ROSWELL S PARK CEMETERY RD IMPROVE 150,000 Roswell

to plan, design, construct and improve streets in South Park cemetery in Roswell in Chaves county

Chaves

CIBOLA CO DISPATCH OFFICE IMPROVE 75,000 Grants

to plan, design, construct, renovate, furnish and equip improvements to the Cibola county dispatch office and office 
of the emergency manager, including relocation, fencing, parking lot and site improvements, in the county complex 
in Grants in Cibola county

Cibola

GRANTS LIFELONG LEARNING CENTER FURNISH & EQUIP 133,000 Grants

to purchase furniture, equipment and information technology, including related infrastructure, for the lifelong 
learning center in Grants in Cibola county

Cibola
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GRANTS LIFELONG LEARNING CTR CONSTRUCT PHASE 2 125,000 Grants

to plan, design and construct phase 2 of the lifelong learning and technology center in Grants in Cibola county

Cibola

MILAN MIRABAL PARK DRAINAGE IMPROVE 150,000 Milan

to plan, design and construct drainage improvements to Mirabal park in Milan in Cibola county

Cibola

ANGEL FIRE FIRE STATION 3/TRAINING FCLTY CONSTRUCT 1,650,000 Angel Fire

to plan, design and construct a fire station and training facility in Angel Fire in Colfax county

Colfax

EAGLE NEST ENCHANTED EAGLE PARK RESTROOMS 135,000 Eagle Nest

to plan, design, construct, furnish and install accessible restrooms in the Enchanted Eagle park in Eagle Nest in 
Colfax county

Colfax

RATON POLICE DEPT VEHICLES PURCHASE 200,000 Raton

to purchase and equip vehicles for the police department in Raton in Colfax county

Colfax

RATON PUB WORKS EQUIPMENT & VEHICLE PURCHASE 200,000 Raton

to purchase machinery, including a wheel loader; snow removal, street maintenance and haulage equipment; and a 
truck, in Raton in Colfax county

Colfax

SCCCSPD MULTIPURPOSE FACILITY CONSTRUCT 1,400,000 Cimarron

to plan, design, construct, furnish and equip a multipurpose facility to house the Cimarron health clinic, community 
meeting room, training facility and ambulance barn for the south central Colfax special hospital district  in Colfax 
county

Colfax

SPRINGER ELECTRICAL SYSTEM IMPROVE 250,000 Springer

to plan, design, construct, purchase and equip electrical system improvements, including replacing transformers 
and underground and aerial conductors, in Springer in Colfax county

Colfax

SPRINGER RECREATIONAL CTR & SWIMMING POOL IMPROVE 15,000 Springer

to plan, design and replace the roof and to improve accessibility to the recreational center and swimming pool in 
Springer in Colfax county

Colfax

CLOVIS FIRE DEPT BRUSH FIRE TRUCK PRCHS EQUIP 250,000 Clovis

to purchase and equip a brush fire truck for the fire department in Clovis in Curry county

Curry

CLOVIS LYCEUM THEATER RENOVATE & RESTORE 50,000 Clovis

to plan, design, renovate, restore, equip, furnish and construct improvements, including a concession facility and 
code and safety improvements, at the Lyceum theater in Clovis in Curry county

Curry

CURRY CO COURTHOUSE RENOVATE 3,000,000 Clovis

to plan, design, renovate and construct improvements to the county courthouse in Clovis in Curry county

Curry

CURRY CO DETENTION CTR ROOF 150,372 Clovis

to plan, design, construct and replace the roof of the juvenile detention center in Clovis in Curry county

Curry

ANTHONY FARMERS MARKET/YOUTH CTR/PARK CONSTRUCT 200,000 Anthony

to plan, design, furnish, equip and construct a farmers market, youth recreation center and park in Anthony in Dona 
Ana county

Dona Ana

ANTHONY REC FLOOD CONTROL BALL FIELD PARK 100,000 Anthony

to plan, design, construct and equip a multipurpose recreational flood control ball field park in Anthony in Dona Ana 
county

Dona Ana

ANTHONY REC FLOOD CONTROL LINEAR PARK 275,000 Anthony

to plan, design, construct, equip and landscape a multipurpose recreational flood control linear park in Anthony in 
Dona Ana county

Dona Ana

CHAMBERINO MDWC&SA BASEBALL PARK IMPROVE 200,000 Chamberino

to plan, design and construct improvements to the Chamberino mutual domestic water consumer and sewer 
association baseball park in Chamberino in Dona Ana county

Dona Ana

DONA ANA CO BERINO PLAYGROUND EQUIP 100,000 Berino

to plan, design, purchase, install, construct and improve playground equipment in Berino in Dona Ana county

Dona Ana
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DONA ANA CO EAST MESA PARK 100,000

to plan, design, construct, purchase and install improvements to the East Mesa park in Dona Ana county.

Dona Ana

DONA ANA CO INTRNATL JETPORT EXPANSION PHASE 2 1,436,073 Santa Teresa

to plan, design, construct and equip phase 2 of the jetport expansion, including an apparatus bay, offices, a kitchen, 
a lobby and a physical fitness room, at the county international jetport in Dona Ana county

Dona Ana

DONA ANA CO MOSQUITO CONTROL EQUIP PURCHASE 35,000

to purchase and equip a mosquito control spraying unit, including a fogger and other related equipment, for Dona 
Ana county

Dona Ana

DONA ANA CO SNM STATE FAIR & RODEO WATER SYS 50,000

to plan, design and construct improvements and repairs to the water system at the southern New Mexico state fair 
and rodeo facility in Dona Ana county

Dona Ana

LAS CRUCES BRANIGAN CULTURAL CTR IMPROVE 100,000 Las Cruces

to plan, design and construct improvements to the Branigan cultural center, including hazardous materials 
abatement and replacement of the ceiling, in Las Cruces in Dona Ana county

Dona Ana

LAS CRUCES FIRE DEPT VEHICLE PURCH 140,000 Las Cruces

to purchase and equip a vehicle for the fire department in Las Cruces in Dona Ana county

Dona Ana

LAS CRUCES FIRE STATION 2 IMPROVE 100,000 Las Cruces

to plan, design and construct improvements to the fire station two building and site, including interior bay repair, 
accessibility features, parking lot and drive pad repair, in Las Cruces in Dona Ana county

Dona Ana

LAS CRUCES PARKS EQUIP & IMPROVE 100,000 Las Cruces

to plan, design, construct, purchase and install playground equipment and improvements to parks in Las Cruces in 
Dona Ana county

Dona Ana

LAS CRUCES POLICE DEPT BODY CAMERAS PURCH 40,000 Las Cruces

to purchase body cameras for the police department in Las Cruces in Dona Ana county

Dona Ana

LAS CRUCES POLICE DEPT DATA TERMINALS 105,000 Las Cruces

to purchase and install mobile data terminals in police department vehicles in Las Cruces in Dona Ana county

Dona Ana

MESILLA PLAZA LIGHTING 112,000 Mesilla

to plan, design, purchase, construct and install lighting improvements in the historic plaza in Mesilla in Dona Ana 
county

Dona Ana

SAN MIGUEL SAVANNAH PARK CONSTRUCT DONA ANA CO 50,000 San Miguel

to plan, design, construct and equip Savannah park in San Miguel in Dona Ana county

Dona Ana

SCRTD BUS PURCHASE 80,000

to purchase a transit bus for the south central regional transit district in Dona Ana county

Dona Ana

SUNLAND PARK LAW ENFORCEMENT VEHICLES 250,000 Sunland Park

to purchase and equip law enforcement vehicles for Sunland Park in Dona Ana county

Dona Ana

ARTESIA WATER TANK PRCHS CONSTRUCT 1,600,000 Artesia

to plan, design, purchase and construct a water tower in Artesia in Eddy county

Eddy

CARLSBAD CAVERN THEATER HVAC/RESTROOM/PLUMBING 250,000 Carlsbad

to plan, design, construct, purchase, install and upgrade a heating, ventilation and air conditioning system, an 
accessible restroom and plumbing at the Cavern theater in Carlsbad in Eddy county

Eddy

CARLSBAD CEMETERY FENCING 325,000 Carlsbad

to purchase, install and construct fencing around Carlsbad cemetery in Carlsbad in Eddy county

Eddy

CARLSBAD IRRIGATION DIST DUMP TRUCK PRCHS EQUIP 100,000

to purchase and equip a dump truck for the Carlsbad irrigation district in Eddy county

Eddy

CARLSBAD JOHN HEATON BLDG/NCKRI SHELVING 80,000 Carlsbad

to purchase and install shelving at the national cave karst research institute in the John Heaton building in Carlsbad 
in Eddy county

Eddy
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CARLSBAD POTASH PARK FENCING 100,000 Carlsbad

to purchase, install and construct fencing around Potash park in Carlsbad in Eddy county

Eddy

CARLSBAD TROY YOUNG PARK ADA RESTROOMS/TABLES 75,000 Carlsbad

to purchase, construct and install prefabricated restrooms and tables to comply with the Americans with Disabilities 
Act of 1990 at Troy Young park in Carlsbad in Eddy county

Eddy

HOPE MAINT BLDG CONSTRUCT & EQUIP 400,000 Hope

to plan, design, purchase, construct and equip a metal frame maintenance building and to purchase equipment in 
Hope in Eddy county

Eddy

HOPE UTILITY PICKUP PRCHS EQUIP 50,000 Hope

to purchase and equip a utility pickup truck in Hope in Eddy county

Eddy

BAYARD RECREATION FACILITY IMPROVE 100,000 Bayard

to plan, design and construct recreational facility improvements, including site work and the purchase of equipment 
and furnishings, in Bayard in Grant county

Grant

GILA REGIONAL MED CTR IMAGING UPGRADE GRANT CO 171,000 Silver City

to purchase and install imaging information technology to upgrade a mammography machine to digital 
tomosynthesis in the Gila regional medical center in Silver City in Grant county

Grant

GRANT CO ADMIN BLDG RENOVATE 143,000 Silver City

to plan, design, construct, renovate and improve the Grant county administration building in Silver City in Grant 
county

Grant

GRANT CO DETENTION CTR IMPROVE 65,000 Silver City

to plan, design, construct, repair and improve the county detention center, including the purchase and installation of 
furniture and equipment, in Silver City in Grant county

Grant

GRANT CO SHERIFF'S DEPT VEHICLES 120,000

to purchase and equip vehicles for the sheriff's department in Grant county

Grant

SANTA CLARA GRANT CO CEMETERY IMPROVE 60,000 Santa Clara

to plan, design, construct, equip and furnish cemetery improvements in Santa Clara in Grant county

Grant

SANTA CLARA POLICE DEPARTMENT IMPROVE 50,000 Santa Clara

to plan, design, construct, furnish and equip improvements to the police department in Santa Clara in Grant county

Grant

GUADALUPE CO PECOS THEATER RENOVATE SANTA ROSA 90,000 Santa Rosa

to plan, design, construct, purchase and install improvements to the Pecos theater in Santa Rosa in Guadalupe 
county

Guadalupe

GUADALUPE CO WILBUR YOUNG BUILDING IMPROVE 90,000 Santa Rosa

to plan, design and construct improvements to the Wilbur Young building in Santa Rosa in Guadalupe county

Guadalupe

NEWKIRK/CUERVO FIRE STATION CONSTRUCT GUADALUPE CO 525,000 Newkirk

to plan, design, construct, equip and furnish a Newkirk/Cuervo fire station in Guadalupe county

Guadalupe

SANTA ROSA BLUE HOLE PARKING FCLTY 50,000 Santa Rosa

to plan, design and construct parking facilities at the Blue hole in Santa Rosa in Guadalupe county

Guadalupe

SANTA ROSA POLICE DEPT VEHICLE & EQUIP 70,000 Santa Rosa

to purchase and equip vehicles and to purchase equipment for the police department in Santa Rosa in Guadalupe 
county

Guadalupe

HARDING CO ARCHIVES AND RECORDS STORAGE 26,000 Mosquero

to plan, purchase and install a temperature-controlled container to store archives and records in Mosquero in 
Harding county

Harding

HARDING CO COURTHOUSE IMPROVEMENTS 150,000 Mosquero

to plan, design, renovate, construct, equip, furnish and install improvements, including replacing the heating, 
ventilation and air conditioning system, upgrading the electrical system and repairing exterior stucco, to the Harding 
county courthouse in Mosquero in Harding county

Harding
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HARDING CO FAIRGROUNDS IMPROVE 160,000 Roy

to plan, design, purchase, construct and equip a concession stand, bathrooms and a recreational vehicle parking 
area at the county fairgrounds in Roy in Harding county

Harding

COTTON CITY ROAD DEPT BUILDING HIDALGO CO 250,000

to plan, design, purchase, equip, furnish and install a modular building for the road department in Cotton City in 
Hidalgo county

Hidalgo

EUNICE FIRE STATION CONSTRUCT EQUIP 700,000 Eunice

to plan, design, purchase, construct and equip a fire station in Eunice in Lea county

Lea

JAL LITTLE LEAGUE BB FIELD 500,000 Jal

to plan, design, construct, improve, furnish and equip a little league baseball field and complex, including lighting, 
fencing, dugouts, restrooms, irrigation, bleachers and parking, in Jal in Lea county

Lea

LEA CO DETENTION CTR EXPAND 1,600,000 Lovington

to plan, design, construct and equip an expansion, including separate areas for male and female mental health 
patient inmates, at the Lea county detention center in Lovington in Lea county

Lea

LEA CO JUDICIAL CMPLX CONSTRUCT 4,750,000 Lovington

to plan, design, construct, purchase and install fixtures, equipment and furnishings, including a security screener 
and cameras, access control, fire alarms, automated heating, ventilation and air conditioning and audiovisual court 
and courtroom directions systems, for a county judicial complex in Lovington in Lea county

Lea

LOVINGTON AERIAL FIREFIGHTING APPARATUS 1,500,000 Lovington

to purchase and equip an aerial firefighting apparatus for the fire department in Lovington in Lea county

Lea

LOVINGTON FIRING RANGE CONSTRUCT EQUIP 254,000 Lovington

to plan, design, construct and equip a firing range for law enforcement agencies in Lovington in Lea county

Lea

LOVINGTON INDUSTRIAL PK INFRA 2,300,000 Lovington

to plan, design, construct and improve infrastructure, including utilities and roads, at the Lovington industrial park in 
Lovington in Lea county

Lea

LOVINGTON SPORTS CMPLX CONSTRUCT 2,800,000 Lovington

to plan, design, construct and equip a sports complex in Lovington in Lea county

Lea

CARRIZOZO FIRE HYDRANTS REPLACE 350,000 Carrizozo

to plan, design, purchase and replace fire hydrants in Carrizozo in Lincoln county

Lincoln

CARRIZOZO POLICE STATION/LIBRARY IMPROVE 100,000 Carrizozo

to plan, design, construct, equip and install improvements, including flooring, fixtures and windows, to the police 
and library building in Carrizozo in Lincoln county

Lincoln

LINCOLN CO DETENTION CENTER EXPAND 600,000 Carrizozo

to plan, design, construct, equip and furnish an expansion, including medical facilities, at the detention center in 
Carrizozo in Lincoln county

Lincoln

RUIDOSO ADMIN OFFICES AND PARKING CONSTRUCT 500,000 Ruidoso

to acquire easements and rights of way and to plan, design, construct and equip administrative offices and a 
parking lot in Ruidoso in Lincoln county

Lincoln

RUIDOSO DOWNS ASPHALT PAVING MACHINE PURCHASE 328,918 Ruidoso Downs

to purchase and equip an asphalt paving machine in Ruidoso Downs in Lincoln county

Lincoln

RUIDOSO EMERGENCY COMMUNICATIONS IMPROVE 175,000 Ruidoso

to plan, design, construct, purchase and install mapping and automation equipment to improve emergency 
communications in Ruidoso in Lincoln county

Lincoln

WHITE OAKS FIRE DEPARTMENT ADDITION 300,000

to plan, design, construct, purchase and install a metal building for the White Oaks fire department in Lincoln county

Lincoln

COLUMBUS HISTORIC SCHOOL BLDG IMPROVE 55,435 Columbus

to plan, design, construct, equip and furnish improvements to the historic school building in Columbus in Luna 
county

Luna
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DEMING CAREER TECH CENTER CONSTRUCT 100,000 Deming

to plan, design, construct, equip and furnish a career tech center located in Deming in Luna county

Luna

LUNA CO DOMESTIC VIOLENCE SHELTER IMPROVE 100,000 Deming

to plan, design, construct, equip and furnish improvements to the domestic violence shelter in Deming in Luna 
county

Luna

GALLUP HAROLD RUNNELS REC BLDG ROOF 434,000 Gallup

to plan, design and replace the roof on the Harold Runnels recreation building in Gallup in McKinley county

McKinley

GALLUP POLICE DEPT VEHICLES PURCHASE 400,000 Gallup

to purchase and equip vehicles for the police department in Gallup in McKinley county

McKinley

THOREAU COMMUNITY COMPLEX CONSTRUCT PHASE 1 150,000 Thoreau

to plan, design and construct a community center complex in Thoreau in McKinley county

McKinley

MORA CO ADMIN/JUDICIAL CMPLX PHASE 3 CONSTRUCT 10,612,597 Mora

to plan, design and construct phase 3 of the county administrative-judicial complex in Mora in Mora county

Mora

MORA CO EMS AMBULANCE PURCHASE 70,000

to purchase and equip an ambulance for emergency medical services in Mora county

Mora

MORA THEATER IMPROVE 50,000 Mora

to plan, design, construct and improve an historic theater in Mora in Mora county

Mora

WATROUS COMM CTR CONSTRUCT PHASE 2 270,000 Watrous

to plan, design, construct, furnish and equip phase two of the community center in Watrous in Mora county

Mora

NORTH CENTRAL RGNL TRANSIT DIST BUSES 736,000

to purchase and equip buses for the north central regional transit district in Rio Arriba, Santa Fe, Los Alamos and 
Taos counties

Multiple Co

ALAMOGORDO FIRE DIST 5 PUMPER APPARATUS PRCHS 625,000 Alamogordo

to purchase and equip a pumper apparatus, including ladders, self-contained breathing apparatus, ventilating 
equipment, first aid kits, hydraulic rescue tools and other equipment, for fire district five in Alamogordo in Otero 
county

Otero

ALAMOGORDO LIB RESTROOMS RENOVATE 100,000 Alamogordo

to plan, design and renovate the public restrooms in the public library in Alamogordo in Otero county

Otero

ALAMOGORDO PLAYGROUND SHADE STRUCTURES 240,000 Alamogordo

to design, construct and equip playground shade structures at Alameda park zoo, Alamogordo family recreation 
center, Griggs field, Hermoso el Sol, Paiute park and University park in Alamogordo in Otero county

Otero

ALAMOGORDO POLICE DEPT VEHICLE & TRAILER PURCHASE 50,000 Alamogordo

to purchase and equip a vehicle and trailer for the police department in Alamogordo in Otero county

Otero

ALAMOGORDO POLICE DEPT VEHICLE PURCHASE 200,000 Alamogordo

to purchase and equip vehicles for the Alamogordo police department in Otero county

Otero

ALAMOGORDO SMALL BUSINESS DEVELOPMENT CENTER 250,000 Alamogordo

to plan, design, renovate, construct, improve and furnish the former Tularosa Basin historical museum building to 
house a small business development center in Alamogordo in Otero county

Otero

OTERO CO EMERGENCY OPERATIONS CENTER 75,000

to design, construct and equip an emergency operations center in Otero county

Otero

TIMBERON FIRE STATION CONSTRUCT OTERO CO 700,000

to plan, design and construct a fire station in Timberon in Otero county

Otero

TIMBERON WSD GRADER PURCHASE 500,000 Timberon

to purchase and equip a grader for the Timberon water and sanitation district in Otero county

Otero
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TIMBERON WSD MAINT BARN AND ELECTRICAL IMPROVE 141,000 Timberon

to demolish, construct, repair, renovate and equip improvements to the Timberon water and sanitation district 
maintenance barn and electrical system in Timberon in Otero county

Otero

TULAROSA PARKS RESTROOMS 100,000 Tularosa

to plan, design, construct and install restrooms in James Vigil park and Veterans park in Tularosa in Otero county

Otero

TULAROSA SKID STEER LOADER PURCHASE 75,000 Tularosa

to purchase and equip a skid steer loader, including a cement mixer and other attachments, in Tularosa in Otero 
county

Otero

TULAROSA SOLID WASTE TRUCK/DUMPSTERS/TRAILER 200,000 Tularosa

to purchase and equip a solid waste truck, dumpsters and a trailer in Tularosa in Otero county

Otero

QUAY CO DETENTION CENTER RENOVATE 300,000 Tucumcari

to plan, design, renovate, construct and equip improvements, including interior and exterior infrastructure and 
housing for inmates with behavioral and mental health issues, to the detention center in Tucumcari in Quay county

Quay

CHAMA CITY HALL CMPLX CONSTRUCT EQUIP 2,000,000 Chama

to plan, design, construct and equip a city hall complex in Chama in Rio Arriba county

Rio Arriba

ESPANOLA RECREATION FACILITY CONSTRUCT 230,000 Española

to plan, design and construct a recreation facility for Espanola in Rio Arriba county

Rio Arriba

RIO ARRIBA CO DRUG REHAB FACILITY CONSTRUCT 200,000 Velarde

to plan, design, construct, renovate and equip a drug addiction rehabilitation facility in Velarde in Rio Arriba county

Rio Arriba

RIO ARRIBA CO FCLTY SOLAR INSTALL & PARKING 20,000

to plan, design, purchase, construct and install solar installations and parking structures at county facilities in Rio 
Arriba county

Rio Arriba

RIO ARRIBA CO PUBLIC SAFETY VEH PRCHS 102,000

to purchase and equip public safety vehicles for Rio Arriba county

Rio Arriba

RIO ARRIBA CO WAREHOUSE CONSTRUCT 200,000 Espanola

to plan, design, construct and equip a county warehouse in Espanola in Rio Arriba county

Rio Arriba

SAN JOAQUIN DEL RIO DE CHAMA LAND GRANT EQUIP 25,000

to purchase and equip a skid steer loader and to purchase equipment for the San Joaquin del Rio de Chama land 
grant in Rio Arriba county

Rio Arriba

ELIDA BACKHOE PURCHASE 120,000 Elida

to purchase and equip a backhoe in Elida in Roosevelt county

Roosevelt

PORTALES CEMETERY IMPROVE 250,000 Portales

to acquire land and to plan, design and construct improvements to the Portales cemetery in Portales in Roosevelt 
county

Roosevelt

PORTALES FIRE DEPT SUBSTATION CONSTRUCT 1,318,639 Portales

to plan, design, construct and equip a fire department substation, including utility connections, in Portales in 
Roosevelt county

Roosevelt

PORTALES POLICE HEADQUARTERS CONSTRUCT 150,000 Portales

to acquire, plan, design, construct and equip a police headquarters facility in Portales in Roosevelt county

Roosevelt

AZTEC HUB BUILDING PURCHASE 155,000 Aztec

to purchase the building that houses the hub business incubator in Aztec in San Juan county

San Juan

BLOOMFIELD POLICE DEPT VEHICLE PURCHASE 53,500 Bloomfield

to purchase and equip vehicles for the police department in Bloomfield in San Juan county

San Juan

FARMINGTON ANIMAS RIVER TRAIL & BRIDGES 4,000,000 Farmington

to acquire land and water rights for and to plan, design, construct and furnish walking trails and bridges along the 
Animas river in Farmington in San Juan county

San Juan
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SJSWCD OFFICE WAREHOUSE FCLTY CONSTRUCT AZTEC 2,000,000 Aztec

to plan, design, construct, equip and furnish a office and warehouse facility for the San Juan soil and water 
conservation district in Aztec in San Juan county

San Juan

SAN MIGUEL CO DETENTION CTR KITCHEN EQUIP 24,500 Las Vegas

to purchase, replace and install kitchen equipment at the county detention center in Las Vegas in San Miguel county

San Miguel

SAN MIGUEL CO DETENTION CTR RECREATION YARD 115,500 Las Vegas

to plan, design, renovate, construct and equip improvements to the inmate recreation yard area at the county 
detention center in Las Vegas in San Miguel county

San Miguel

SAN MIGUEL CO DETENTION CTR RUBBERIZED FLOOR 18,000 Las Vegas

to purchase and install rubberized floor surface in the kitchen, laundry and maintenance shop areas of the county 
detention center in Las Vegas in San Miguel county

San Miguel

SAN MIGUEL CO DETENTION CTR WASHER/DRYER 11,223 Las Vegas

to purchase and install a clothes washer and dryer for the women's housing unit at the county detention center in 
Las Vegas in San Miguel county

San Miguel

SAN MIGUEL CO FAIRGRNDS FCLTY REN/IMPROVE 15,000 Las Vegas

to plan, design, renovate and construct facility improvements to the county fairgrounds in Las Vegas in San Miguel 
county

San Miguel

SAN MIGUEL CO FAIRGROUNDS EXHIBIT HALL ROOF 15,000

to plan, design, construct, replace and renovate the exhibit hall roof and insulation, including the purchase and 
installation of related equipment, at the county fairgrounds in San Miguel county

San Miguel

SAN MIGUEL CO PUBLIC SERVICES DIV EQUIP PRCHS 135,000

to purchase and equip trucks and equipment for the public services division of San Miguel county

San Miguel

CORRALES ANIMAL SVC TRUCK & TRAILER PRCHS EQUIP 35,000 Corrales

to purchase and equip a truck and livestock trailer for animal services in Corrales in Sandoval county

Sandoval

CORRALES GYMNASIUM ROOF IMPROVE 20,000 Corrales

to plan, design, construct, equip and install improvements to the roof of a village gymnasium to accommodate solar 
installations in Corrales in Sandoval county

Sandoval

CORRALES POLICE VEH PRCHS EQUIP 30,000 Corrales

to purchase and equip police vehicles for Corrales in Sandoval county

Sandoval

CORRALES PUBLIC WORKS BLDG EQUIP 30,000 Corrales

to plan, design, construct and equip heating, plumbing and electrical services for a public works building in Corrales 
in Sandoval county

Sandoval

CORRALES RECORDS STORAGE UNITS 30,000 Corrales

to purchase and install shelving and furniture for storage of electronic and print records in Corrales in Sandoval 
county

Sandoval

RIO RANCHO AMBULANCE PURCHASE 200,000 Rio Rancho

to purchase and equip an ambulance for the fire and rescue department in Rio Rancho in Sandoval county

Sandoval

RIO RANCHO FIRE DEPT EQUIP 93,346 Rio Rancho

to purchase fire protection and emergency medical equipment for the fire and rescue department in Rio Rancho in 
Sandoval county

Sandoval

RIO RANCHO PARKS IMPROVE ADA COMPLIANCE 292,709 Rio Rancho

to plan, design, construct, equip and improve park facilities to comply with the Americans with Disabilities Act of 
1990 in Rio Rancho in Sandoval county

Sandoval

RIO RANCHO POLICE DEPT VEHICLES PURCH 400,000 Rio Rancho

to purchase and equip vehicles for the police department in Rio Rancho in Sandoval county

Sandoval

SANDOVAL CO SHERIFF'S DEPT VEHICLE PURCH & EQUIP 486,000

to purchase and equip vehicles for the sheriff's department in Sandoval county

Sandoval
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COMUNIDAD DE LOS NINOS HEAD START SEWER LINES 52,000 Santa Fe

to plan, design, construct and make improvements to sewage lines and related infrastructure at the city of Santa 
Fe's Comunidad de los Ninos head start center in Santa Fe in Santa Fe county

Santa Fe

EDGEWOOD CMTY CTR PK SKATEBOARD/PGRND IMPROVE 10,000 Edgewood

to purchase and install playground and skateboard park equipment and features for the community center park in 
Edgewood in Santa Fe county

Santa Fe

EDGEWOOD ROAD MAINTENANCE WATER TRUCK 175,000 Edgewood

to purchase and equip a road maintenance water truck for Edgewood in Santa Fe county

Santa Fe

SANTA FE AIRPORT TERMINAL & FACILITIES EXPAND 1,000,000 Santa Fe

to design and construct an expansion of the Santa Fe airport terminal and facilities in accordance with the airport 
master plan in Santa Fe in Santa Fe county

Santa Fe

SANTA FE CO BOYS & GIRLS CLUB FCLTIES IMPROVE 50,000 Santa Cruz

to plan, design, construct and equip improvements to the Santa Cruz housing authority's boys and girls clubs 
facilities in Santa Cruz in Santa Fe county

Santa Fe

SANTA FE CULTURAL/ARTS FACILITY IMPROVE 80,000 Santa Fe

to plan, design and construct interior and exterior renovations to the roof of a cultural and arts facility in Santa Fe in 
Santa Fe county

Santa Fe

SANTA FE DANCE BARNS PRCHS EQUIP 50,000 Santa Fe

to purchase and install equipment for the dance barns facility in Santa Fe in Santa Fe county

Santa Fe

SANTA FE MEAL PROGRAM FCLTY CONSTRUCT EQUIP 300,000 Santa Fe

to plan, design, renovate, construct, improve and equip a facility and to purchase and install information technology, 
including related equipment, furniture and infrastructure, for a meals program serving homebound and special 
needs individuals in Santa Fe in Santa Fe county

Santa Fe

SANTA FE SWAN REGIONAL PARK 250,000 Santa Fe

to plan, design and construct the Southwest Activity Node regional park, including a road, utility infrastructure, a 
maintenance shop, restrooms, tennis/pickle ball courts, shade structures, picnic tables, site improvements and 
concession, parking and recreational facilities, in Santa Fe in Santa Fe County

Santa Fe

ELEPHANT BUTTE PLAYGROUND AND EXERCISE EQUIPMENT 80,000 Elephant Butte

to purchase and install playground and adult exercise equipment in city parks and facilities in Elephant Butte in 
Sierra county

Sierra

SIERRA CO ADMIN CMPLX CONSTRUCT 7,000,000

to acquire land and to plan, design, construct, equip and furnish an administration complex in Sierra county

Sierra

SIERRA CO FIRE DEPTS PUMPER/TANKER PURCH 300,000

to purchase and equip a pumper/tanker vehicle for the fire departments in Sierra county

Sierra

SIERRA CO ROAD DEPARTMENT EQUIPMENT 680,000

to purchase and equip county road department equipment in Sierra county

Sierra

T OR C REGIONAL LAW ENFORCEMENT COMPLEX CONSTRUCT 2,600,000 Truth or Consequences

to plan, design, construct and equip a regional law enforcement complex in Truth or Consequences in Sierra county

Sierra

SABINAL/ABEYTAS COMMUNITY CTR SOCORRO CO 150,000

to purchase and install utility infrastructure and equipment and to renovate, construct and equip the main hall, 
bathrooms and kitchen in the community center/commercial kitchen in Sabinal in Socorro county

Socorro

SOCORRO MLTPRPS RECREATIONAL COMPLEX 400,000 Socorro

to plan, design, construct and improve a multipurpose complex, including parking lots, lighting, bleachers and 
recreational vehicle park facilities, in Socorro in Socorro county

Socorro

DON FERNANDO DE TAOS LAND GRANT BLDG 75,000

to acquire land for and to plan, design and construct a building for the Don Fernando de Taos land grant-merced in 
Taos county

Taos
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LA MERCED DE SANTA BARBARA MULTIPURPOSE BLDGS 25,000 Penasco

to acquire land and to plan, design, purchase, construct, renovate and equip administrative and multipurpose 
buildings for La Merced de Santa Barbara in Taos county

Taos

QUESTA ECON DEVELOP PROJECT 1,500,000 Questa

to purchase land and equipment and to plan, design and construct economic development projects in Questa in 
Taos county

Taos

QUESTA VETERANS MEMORIAL PARK IMPROVE 3,000 Questa

to plan, design and construct improvements to the Veterans memorial park, including a memorial stone for World 
War II and Korean conflict veterans, in Questa in Taos county

Taos

TALPA COMMUNITY CTR HVAC WINDOWS & ROOF 150,000

to plan, design, construct, repair, upgrade and equip the heating, ventilation and air conditioning system, windows 
and roof at the Talpa community center and library in Taos county

Taos

TAOS CO RESIDENTIAL TREATMENT FCLTY IMPROVE 150,000 Taos

to plan, design, renovate, construct and equip improvements, including plumbing, to a residential treatment facility 
in Taos in Taos county

Taos

TAOS CO SHERIFF'S DEPT VEHICLES PURCHASE 65,000

to purchase and equip vehicles for the sheriff's department in Taos county

Taos

MANZANO COMMUNITY BLDG PURCHASE 200,000

to purchase a building for a multipurpose center in Manzano in Torrance county

Torrance

PUNTA DE AGUA MULTIPURPOSE BLDG CONSTRUCT 185,000

to plan, design and construct a multipurpose building in Punta de Agua in Torrance county

Torrance

TAJIQUE LAND GRANT COMMUNITY CENTER IMPROVE 25,000 Town of Tajique Land 

to plan, design, purchase, install, construct, furnish and equip improvements, including windows, flooring and 
playground equipment, to a community center in Tajique in the town of Tajique land grant in Torrance county

Torrance

UNION CO COURTHOUSE IMPROVE 1,050,000 Clayton

to plan, design, construct, furnish, equip and make improvements to the Union county courthouse, including jury 
room expansion, in Clayton in Union county

Union

UNION CO LAW ENFORCEMENT COMPLEX IMPROVE 665,000 Clayton

to plan, design, construct, purchase, equip and improve office space, including furniture, for the county law 
enforcement complex in Clayton in Union county

Union

UNION CO OFFICES IMPROVE 766,500 Clayton

to plan, design, construct, purchase, equip and improve office space, including furniture, for the assessor, clerk, 
probate judge, treasurer and county commission in Clayton in Union county

Union

BELEN GIS INFO TECH 275,000 Belen

to purchase geographic information system technology, including related infrastructure and equipment, to develop 
and implement a data management system for Belen in Valencia county

Valencia

LOS LUNAS HUNING RANCH PARK IMPROVE/TENNIS 500,000 Los Lunas

to plan, design and construct improvements to Huning Ranch park, including tennis courts, lighting, pedestrian 
walkways and fencing, in Los Lunas in Valencia county

Valencia

LOS LUNAS SPORTS COMPLEX IMPROVE 475,000 Los Lunas

to plan, design, construct and make improvements to the sports complex, including restrooms, entrance, parking, 
drainage, gates and fencing, stage, jogging paths, fields and accessibility, in Los Lunas in Valencia county

Valencia

RIO COMMUNITIES PUBLIC SAFETY EQUIP VALENCIA CO 50,000 Rio Communities

to purchase and equip public safety equipment, including a generator, for the Rio Grande estates fire department in 
Rio Communities in Valencia county

Valencia

VALENCIA CO ADMIN OFFICES RENOVATE/REMEDIATE 300,010

for health and safety code compliance renovations, including hazardous materials removal and remediation, in the 
Valencia county administrative offices in Los Lunas in Valencia county

Valencia
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VALENCIA CO ADMIN/COURT BLDGS SECURITY SYSTEM 120,000

to purchase and install security system equipment in the administrative buildings and thirteenth judicial district court 
building in Valencia county

Valencia

VALENCIA CO CARDIAC MONITORS PURCHASE 126,015

to purchase cardiac monitors for emergency service personnel in Valencia county

Valencia

VALENCIA CO PUBLIC SAFETY VEHICLES/EQUIP 160,000

to purchase and equip public safety vehicles with inter-operable communication equipment in Valencia county

Valencia

VALENCIA CO VOTER REGISTRATION EQUIP 57,000

to purchase and install voter registration filing system equipment in Valencia county

Valencia

Agency: HIGHLANDS UNIVERSITY, NEW MEXICO

NMHU 310 MILLS AVE RENOVATE 147,500 Las Vegas

to plan, design, construct, renovate and equip the building located at 310 Mills avenue in Las Vegas in San Miguel 
county

San Miguel

NMHU FACILITIES SERVICES CONSTRUCT 7,175,187 Las Vegas

for site improvements and to plan, design, demolish, construct and replace the facilities services building, including 
purchase and installation of furniture and equipment, at New Mexico highlands university in Las Vegas in San 
Miguel county

San Miguel

NMHU INFRASTRUCTURE 8,000,000 Las Vegas

for site improvements and to plan, design, construct, relocate, renovate and equip critical infrastructure at New 
Mexico highlands university in Las Vegas in San Miguel county

San Miguel

Agency: MINING AND TECHNOLOGY, NEW MEXICO INSTITUTE OF

NMIMT CHILLER 700,000 Socorro

to purchase and install a chiller at New Mexico institute of mining and technology in Socorro in Socorro county

Socorro

NMIMT INFO TECH & VEHICLE FOR NM MESA PROGRAM 55,800

to purchase and install information technology, including related equipment and furniture, and to purchase a vehicle 
for regional offices statewide participating in the New Mexico mathematics, engineering and science achievement 
program through the New Mexico institute of mining and technology

Statewide

Agency: NEW MEXICO STATE UNIVERSITY

NMSU-GRANTS FIDEL HALL RENOVATE 600,000 Grants

to plan, design, construct, renovate, furnish and equip improvements to Fidel hall at the Grants branch campus of 
New Mexico state university in Cibola county

Cibola

NMSU CAMPUS INFRA & ROOF REPLACEMENT DACC 2,000,000

to plan, design, construct, renovate and equip improvements, including roof replacement and infrastructure, for New 
Mexico state university facilities at Dona Ana community college in Dona Ana county

Dona Ana

NMSU REGENTS ROW RESIDENCE FCLTY DEMOLISH 1,600,000 Las Cruces

to plan, design, abate hazardous materials and demolish a residence facility at New Mexico state university in Las 
Cruces in Dona Ana county

Dona Ana

NMSU WOMEN'S ATHLETIC FACILITIES IMPROVE 250,000 Las Cruces

to plan, design, construct, renovate and equip improvements to women's athletic facilities at New Mexico state 
university in Las Cruces in Dona Ana county

Dona Ana

CARLSBAD SWCD OFFICE ROOF 45,000 Carlsbad

to plan, design, construct, purchase and install a roof for the Carlsbad soil and water conservation district office in 
Carlsbad in Eddy county

Eddy
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NMSU-CARLSBAD LEARNING ASSISTANCE CTR 600,000 Carlsbad

to plan, design, construct, renovate and equip the learning assistance center at the Carlsbad branch campus of 
New Mexico state university in Eddy county

Eddy

NMSU-ALAMOGORDO ROOFS 1,000,000 Alamogordo

to plan, design, construct, renovate and equip roofs on buildings at the Alamogordo branch campus of New Mexico 
state university in Otero county

Otero

SANTA FE POJOAQUE SWCD SANTA CRUZ DAM SITE 1 REHAB 425,000

to plan, design, improve and construct the Santa Cruz flood control dam site 1 located in the Santa Fe-Pojoaque 
soil and water conservation district in Rio Arriba county

Statewide

Agency: NORTHERN NEW MEXICO STATE SCHOOL

NNMSS ESPANOLA EMERGENCY DIESEL GENERATOR 53,250 Espanola

to purchase, construct, equip and install an emergency diesel generator, including a concrete pad, trench and 
connections, at the Espanola campus of northern New Mexico state school in Rio Arriba county

Rio Arriba

Agency: PUBLIC EDUCATION DEPARTMENT

21ST CENTURY CHARTER SCHL IMPROVE 250,000 Albuquerque

to plan, design, construct, renovate, furnish and equip buildings and grounds, including the purchase of a security 
system, phone system, electronic sign and installation of related equipment, fencing, information technology, wiring 
and infrastructure, in the Twenty-First Century charter school in Albuquerque in Bernalillo county

Bernalillo

A. MONTOYA ELEM SCHL LIB 95,000 Albuquerque PSD

to plan, design, construct, improve, renovate, furnish and equip the library, including the purchase of equipment, 
furniture, fixtures, bookshelves and information technology, at A. Montoya elementary school in the Albuquerque 
public school district in Bernalillo county

Bernalillo

ADOBE ACRES ELEM SCHL GROUNDS/TRACK AREAS 61,000 Albuquerque PSD

​to plan, design, renovate and construct improvements to the grounds, fields and track areas, including the purchase 
and installation of related equipment, furniture and landscaping, at Adobe Acres elementary school in the 
Albuquerque public school district in Bernalillo county

Bernalillo

ALAMEDA ELEM SCHL BLDG/GROUNDS 105,000 Albuquerque PSD

to plan, design, construct, improve, renovate, furnish and equip buildings, facilities and grounds, including the 
purchase and installation of related equipment, infrastructure, benches, tables, fixtures and furniture, at Alameda 
elementary school in the Albuquerque public school district in Bernalillo county

Bernalillo

ALAMOSA ELEM SCHL SECURITY 83,000 Albuquerque PSD

to purchase and install security cameras, including related equipment, information technology, an access card 
security system, furniture, infrastructure and improvements, at Alamosa elementary school in the Albuquerque 
public school district in Bernalillo county

Bernalillo

ALB SCHL OF EXCELLENCE CHARTER SCHL EQUIP 150,000 Albuquerque

to plan, design, furnish, equip and install improvements to the Albuquerque School of Excellence charter school, 
including the purchase and installation of science and robotics-related equipment, information technology, 
infrastructure, fixtures and furniture, in Albuquerque in Bernalillo county

Bernalillo

ALBUQUERQUE HIGH SCHL SECURITY 150,000 Albuquerque PSD

to purchase and install security cameras, including related equipment, information technology, an access card 
security system, furniture, infrastructure and improvements, at Albuquerque high school in the Albuquerque public 
school district in Bernalillo county

Bernalillo

ALBUQUERQUE SIGN LANGUAGE ACAD BLDG CONSTRUCT 650,000 Albuquerque

to plan, design and construct a facility for the Albuquerque sign language academy in Albuquerque in Bernalillo 
county

Bernalillo

ALVARADO ELEM SCHL BLDG REN 102,000 Albuquerque PSD

​to plan, design, construct, improve, renovate, furnish and equip buildings and facilities, including the purchase and 
installation of related equipment, infrastructure, fixtures and furniture, at Alvarado elementary school in the 
Albuquerque public school district in Bernalillo county

Bernalillo
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APACHE ELEM SCHL GROUNDS/PGRND PHASE 2 100,000 Albuquerque PSD

​to plan, design, construct and landscape the grounds, courtyards, buildings and facilities, including the purchase 
and installation of related equipment, fencing, shade structures, benches, tables and furniture, at Apache 
elementary school in the Albuquerque public school district in Bernalillo county

Bernalillo

ARMIJO ELEM SCHL SECURITY 80,000 Albuquerque PSD

to purchase and install security cameras, including related equipment, information technology, an access card 
security system, furniture, infrastructure and improvements, at Armijo elementary school in the Albuquerque public 
school district in Bernalillo county

Bernalillo

ARROYO DEL OSO ELEM SCHL BLDG/GROUNDS 75,000 Albuquerque PSD

​to plan, design, construct, improve, renovate, furnish and equip buildings, facilities and grounds, including the 
purchase and installation of related equipment, infrastructure, benches, tables, fixtures and furniture, at Arroyo Del 
Oso elementary school in the Albuquerque public school district in Bernalillo county

Bernalillo

ATRISCO ELEM SCHL SECURITY 150,000 Albuquerque PSD

to purchase and install security cameras, including related equipment, information technology, an access card 
security system, furniture, infrastructure and improvements, at Atrisco elementary school in the Albuquerque public 
school district in Bernalillo county

Bernalillo

ATRISCO HERITAGE ACAD HIGH SCHL ACCESS ROAD 300,000 Albuquerque PSD

to plan, design and construct an east access road, including improvements to Senator Dennis Chavez boulevard 
and one hundred eighteenth street and driveway and trail connections, for Atrisco Heritage academy high school in 
the Albuquerque public school district in Bernalillo county

Bernalillo

ATRISCO HERITAGE HIGH SCHL BLDG/GROUNDS 70,000 Albuquerque PSD

​to plan, design, construct and landscape the grounds, courtyards, buildings and facilities, including the purchase 
and installation of related equipment, fencing, shade structures, benches, tables and furniture, at Atrisco Heritage 
high school in the Albuquerque public school district in Bernalillo county

Bernalillo

BANDELIER ELEM SCHL LIB PHASE 2 21,000 Albuquerque PSD

to plan, design, construct, improve, renovate, furnish and equip the library, including the purchase of equipment, 
furniture, fixtures, bookshelves  and information technology, at Bandelier elementary school in the Albuquerque 
public school district in Bernalillo county

Bernalillo

BARCELONA ELEM SCHL BLDG/GROUNDS 75,000 Albuquerque PSD

​to plan, design, construct and landscape the grounds, courtyards, buildings and facilities, including the purchase 
and installation of related equipment, fencing, shade structures, benches, tables and furniture, at Barcelona 
elementary school in the Albuquerque public school district in Bernalillo county

Bernalillo

BEL-AIR ELEM SCHL GROUNDS/FLDS 100,000 Albuquerque PSD

to plan, design, construct, improve, landscape, equip and furnish the grounds, courtyards and fields, including the 
purchase and installation of related equipment, drainage, bleachers, fencing, shade structures and furniture, at Bel-
Air elementary school in the Albuquerque public school district in Bernalillo county

Bernalillo

BELLEHAVEN ELEM SCHL GROUNDS/PGRND PHASE 2 160,000 Albuquerque PSD

​to plan, design, construct, improve, landscape and equip the grounds and playgrounds, including the purchase and 
installation of related equipment, fencing, shade structures and drainage improvements, at Bellehaven elementary 
school in the Albuquerque public school district in Bernalillo county

Bernalillo

CAREER ENRICHMENT CENTER BLDG/GROUNDS 95,000 Albuquerque PSD

​to plan, design, construct, improve, renovate, furnish and equip buildings, facilities and grounds, including the 
purchase and installation of related equipment, infrastructure, benches, tables, fixtures and furniture, at the Career 
Enrichment Center in the Albuquerque public school district in Bernalillo county

Bernalillo

CARLOS REY ELEM SCHL GROUNDS/PLAYGROUNDS 145,000 Albuquerque PSD

​to plan, design, construct, improve, landscape and equip the grounds and playgrounds, including the purchase and 
installation of related equipment, fencing, shade structures and drainage improvements, at Carlos Rey elementary 
school in the Albuquerque public school district in Bernalillo county

Bernalillo

CESAR CHAVEZ COMMUNITY SCHL IMPROVE 75,000 Albuquerque

to plan, design, construct, renovate, furnish and equip buildings and grounds, and for installation of related 
equipment, fencing, information technology, wiring and infrastructure in the Cesar Chavez community school in 
Albuquerque in Bernalillo county

Bernalillo
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CHAMIZA ELEM SCHL PGRND 106,000 Albuquerque PSD

​to plan, design, construct, improve, landscape and equip the grounds and playgrounds, including the purchase and 
installation of related equipment, fencing, shade structures and drainage improvements, at Chamiza elementary 
school in the Albuquerque public school district in Bernalillo county

Bernalillo

CHAPARRAL ELEM SCHL GROUNDS/FLDS 76,000 Albuquerque PSD

to plan, design, construct, improve, landscape, equip and furnish the grounds, courtyards and fields, including the 
purchase and installation of related equipment, drainage, bleachers, fencing, shade structures and furniture, at 
Chaparral elementary school in the Albuquerque public school district in Bernalillo county

Bernalillo

CHELWOOD ELEM SCHL GROUNDS/PGRND 150,000 Albuquerque PSD

​to plan, design, construct, improve, landscape and equip the grounds and playgrounds, including the purchase and 
installation of related equipment, fencing, shade structures and drainage improvements, at Chelwood elementary 
school in the Albuquerque public school district in Bernalillo county

Bernalillo

CIBOLA HIGH SCHL FINE ARTS FCLTY 180,000 Albuquerque PSD

​to plan, design, construct, renovate and equip the fine arts buildings, facilities and performing arts center, including 
the purchase and installation of stage curtains, seating, carpet, sound and lighting systems, refinishing of stages, 
information technology and related equipment, furniture and infrastructure, at Cibola high school in the Albuquerque 
public school district in Bernalillo county

Bernalillo

CIEN AGUAS INTERNATIONAL SCHL IMPROVE 60,000 Albuquerque

to plan, design, construct, renovate, furnish and equip the buildings and grounds, including the purchase and 
installation of a security system, a phone system, an electronic sign and related equipment, fencing, information 
technology, wiring and infrastructure, at Cien Aguas International school in Albuquerque in Bernalillo county

Bernalillo

CLEVELAND MID SCHL BLDG/GROUNDS 40,000 Albuquerque PSD

​to plan, design, construct and landscape the grounds, courtyards, buildings and facilities, including the purchase 
and installation of related equipment, fencing, shade structures, benches, tables and furniture, at Cleveland middle 
school in the Albuquerque public school district in Bernalillo county

Bernalillo

COCHITI ELEM SCHL GROUNDS/PGRND 105,000 Albuquerque PSD

​to plan, design, construct, improve, landscape and equip the grounds and playgrounds, including the purchase and 
installation of related equipment, fencing, shade structures and drainage improvements, at Cochiti elementary 
school in the Albuquerque public school district in Bernalillo county

Bernalillo

COLLET PARK ELEM SCHL GROUNDS/PGRND PHASE 2 127,000 Albuquerque PSD

​to plan, design, construct and landscape the grounds, courtyards, buildings and facilities, including the purchase 
and installation of related equipment, fencing, shade structures, benches, tables and furniture, at Collet Park 
elementary school in the Albuquerque public school district in Bernalillo county

Bernalillo

COMANCHE ELEM SCHL GROUNDS/PGRND PHASE 2 150,000 Albuquerque PSD

​to plan, design, construct, improve, landscape and equip the grounds and playgrounds, including the purchase and 
installation of related equipment, fencing, shade structures and drainage improvements, at Comanche elementary 
school in the Albuquerque public school district in Bernalillo county

Bernalillo

CORONADO ELEM SCHL GROUNDS/PKG LOT 52,000 Albuquerque PSD

​to plan, design, construct, renovate and landscape the grounds, drainage and parking lot areas, including purchase 
and installation of related equipment, shade structures, furniture and fencing, at Coronado elementary school in the 
Albuquerque public school district in Bernalillo county

Bernalillo

CORRALES ELEM SCHL GROUNDS/PKG LOT 39,000 Albuquerque PSD

​to plan, design, construct, renovate and landscape the grounds, drainage and parking lot areas, including purchase 
and installation of related equipment, shade structures, furniture and fencing, at Corrales elementary school in the 
Albuquerque public school district in Bernalillo county

Bernalillo

DEL NORTE HIGH SCHL FINE ARTS FCLTY PHASE 2 150,000 Albuquerque PSD

​to plan, design, construct, renovate and equip the fine arts building, facilities and performing arts center, including 
the purchase and installation of stage curtains, seating, carpet, sound and lighting systems, refinishing of stages, 
information technology and related equipment, furniture and infrastructure, at Del Norte high school in the 
Albuquerque public school district in Bernalillo county

Bernalillo
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DENNIS CHAVEZ ELEM SCHL BLDG/GROUNDS 159,000 Albuquerque PSD

​to plan, design, construct, improve and landscape the grounds, courtyards, buildings and facilities, including the 
purchase and installation of related equipment, fencing, shade structures, benches, tables and furniture, at Dennis 
Chavez elementary school in the Albuquerque public school district in Bernalillo county

Bernalillo

DESERT RIDGE MID SCHL GROUNDS/FLDS 81,000 Albuquerque PSD

​to plan, design, construct, improve, furnish and landscape the grounds, fields, basketball and tennis court areas, 
including the purchase and installation of related equipment, fencing, court resurfacing, base pavement and 
striping, at Desert Ridge middle school in the Albuquerque public school district in Bernalillo county

Bernalillo

DIGITAL ARTS & TECH ACAD CH SCHL GROUNDS IMPROVE 100,000 Albuquerque PSD

to plan, design, construct, improve, renovate, furnish and equip facilities, grounds and fields, including the purchase 
and installation of related equipment, infrastructure, drainage, grading, turf, fencing, benches, tables, shade 
structures, fixtures and furniture, at Digital Arts and Technology academy charter school in Albuquerque in 
Bernalillo county

Bernalillo

DOUBLE EAGLE ELEM SCHL GROUNDS/PGRND PHASE 2 235,000 Albuquerque PSD

​to plan, design, construct, improve, landscape and equip the grounds and playgrounds, including the purchase and 
installation of related equipment, fencing, shade structures and drainage improvements, at Double Eagle 
elementary school in the Albuquerque public school district in Bernalillo county

Bernalillo

DOUGLAS MACARTHUR ELEM SCHL SECURITY 80,000 Albuquerque PSD

to purchase and install security cameras, including related equipment, information technology, an access card 
security system, furniture, infrastructure and improvements, at Douglas MacArthur elementary school in the 
Albuquerque public school district in Bernalillo county

Bernalillo

DURANES ELEM SCHL GROUNDS/PGRND 104,000 Albuquerque PSD

​to plan, design, construct, improve, landscape and equip the grounds and playgrounds, including the purchase and 
installation of related equipment, fencing, shade structures and drainage improvements, at Duranes elementary 
school in the Albuquerque public school district in Bernalillo county

Bernalillo

EARLY COLLEGE ACADEMY BLDG/GROUNDS 50,000 Albuquerque PSD

​to plan, design, construct and landscape the grounds, courtyards, buildings and facilities, including the purchase 
and installation of related equipment, fencing, shade structures, benches, tables and furniture, at the Early College 
academy in the Albuquerque public school district in Bernalillo county

Bernalillo

EAST MOUNTAIN HIGH SCHL EXTERIOR DOORS REPLACE 85,000 Sandia Park

to replace exterior doors at East Mountain high school in Sandia Park in Bernalillo county

Bernalillo

EAST SAN JOSE ELEM SCHL GROUNDS/PGRND 51,000 Albuquerque PSD

​to plan, design, construct, improve, landscape and equip the grounds and playgrounds, including the purchase and 
installation of related equipment, fencing, shade structures and drainage improvements, at East San Jose 
elementary school in the Albuquerque public school district in Bernalillo county

Bernalillo

EDMUND G. ROSS ELEM SCHL GROUNDS/PGRND PHASE 2 30,000 Albuquerque PSD

​to plan, design, construct, improve, landscape and equip the grounds and playgrounds, including the purchase and 
installation of related equipment, fencing, shade structures and drainage improvements, at Edmund G. Ross 
elementary school in the Albuquerque public school district in Bernalillo county

Bernalillo

EDWARD GONZALES ELEM SCHL GROUNDS/FLDS 75,000 Albuquerque PSD

​to plan, design, construct, improve, landscape, equip and furnish the grounds, courtyards and fields, including the 
purchase and installation of related equipment, drainage, bleachers, fencing, shade structures and furniture, at 
Edward Gonzales elementary school in the Albuquerque public school district in Bernalillo county

Bernalillo

EISENHOWER MID SCHL LIB 50,000 Albuquerque PSD

to plan, design, construct, improve, renovate, furnish and equip the library, including the purchase of equipment, 
furniture, fixtures, bookshelves and information technology, at Eisenhower middle school in the Albuquerque public 
school district in Bernalillo county

Bernalillo

EL CAMINO REAL ACAD CH SCHL IMPROVE 150,000 Albuquerque PSD

to plan, design, purchase, construct, renovate, equip and install improvements to the buildings and grounds, 
including a heating, ventilation and air conditioning system, fencing and information technology, including related 
equipment, furniture and infrastructure, at El Camino Real academy charter school in the Albuquerque public 
school district in Bernalillo county

Bernalillo
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ELDORADO HIGH SCHL GROUNDS/FLDS 324,000 Albuquerque PSD

to plan, design, construct, improve, landscape, equip and furnish the grounds, courtyards and fields, including the 
purchase and installation of related equipment, drainage, bleachers, fencing, shade structures and furniture, at 
Eldorado high school in the Albuquerque public school district in Bernalillo county

Bernalillo

ELDORADO HIGH SCHL SCOREBOARDS 75,000 Albuquerque PSD

​to plan, design, construct, improve, landscape, equip and furnish the grounds, courtyards and fields, including the 
purchase and installation of related equipment, drainage, bleachers, fencing, shade structures, scoreboards and 
furniture, at Eldorado high school in the Albuquerque public school district in Bernalillo county

Bernalillo

EMERSON ELEM SCHL LIB 165,000 Albuquerque PSD

to plan, design, construct, improve, renovate, furnish and equip the library, including the purchase of equipment, 
furniture, fixtures, bookshelves and information technology, at Emerson elementary school in the Albuquerque 
public school district in Bernalillo county

Bernalillo

ERNIE PYLE MID SCHL BLDGS/GROUNDS 22,000 Albuquerque PSD

​to plan, design, construct and landscape the grounds, courtyards, buildings and facilities, including the purchase 
and installation of related equipment, fencing, shade structures, benches, tables and furniture, at Ernie Pyle middle 
school in the Albuquerque public school district in Bernalillo county

Bernalillo

EUGENE FIELD ELEM SCHL SECURITY 80,000 Albuquerque PSD

to purchase and install security cameras, including related equipment, information technology, an access card 
security system, furniture, infrastructure and improvements, at Eugene Field elementary school in the Albuquerque 
public school district in Bernalillo county

Bernalillo

FREEDOM HIGH SCHL GROUNDS/FLDS 100,000 Albuquerque PSD

​to plan, design, construct, landscape, equip and furnish the grounds, courtyards and fields, including the purchase 
and installation of related equipment, drainage, bleachers, fencing, shade structures and furniture, at Freedom high 
school in the Albuquerque public school district in Bernalillo county

Bernalillo

GARFIELD MID SCHL LIBRARY 107,000 Albuquerque PSD

to plan, design, construct, improve, renovate, furnish and equip the library, including the purchase of equipment, 
furniture, fixtures, bookshelves and information technology, at Garfield middle school in the Albuquerque public 
school district in Bernalillo county

Bernalillo

GEORGE I. SANCHEZ COLLABORATIVE CMTY SCH BLDGS/GRN 45,000 Albuquerque PSD

​to plan, design, construct and landscape the grounds, courtyards, buildings and facilities, including the purchase 
and installation of related equipment, fencing, shade structures, benches, tables and furniture, at George I. 
Sanchez collaborative community school in the Albuquerque public school district in Bernalillo county

Bernalillo

GILBERT L. SENA CHARTER HIGH SCL IMPROVE ALB 75,000 Albuquerque

to plan, design, construct, renovate, furnish and equip buildings and grounds, including installation of a science lab 
and lunch area and installation of related equipment, fencing, information technology, wiring and infrastructure in 
the Gilbert Sena charter high school in Albuquerque in Bernalillo county

Bernalillo

GOVERNOR BENT ELEM SCHL BLDGS/GROUNDS PHASE 2 76,000 Albuquerque PSD

​to plan, design, construct and landscape the grounds, courtyards, buildings and facilities, including the purchase 
and installation of related equipment, fencing, shade structures, benches, tables and furniture, at Governor Bent 
elementary school in the Albuquerque public school district in Bernalillo county

Bernalillo

GRANT MID SCHL GROUNDS/FLDS 84,000 Albuquerque PSD

​to plan, design, construct, improve, furnish and landscape the grounds, fields and basketball or tennis court areas, 
including purchase and installation of related equipment, fencing, court resurfacing, base pavement and striping, at 
Grant middle school in the Albuquerque public school district in Bernalillo county

Bernalillo

GRIEGOS ELEM SCHL GROUNDS/PGRND PHASE 3 129,000 Albuquerque PSD

​to plan, design, construct, improve, landscape and equip the grounds and playgrounds, including the purchase and 
installation of related equipment, fencing, shade structures and drainage improvements, at Griegos elementary 
school in the Albuquerque public school district in Bernalillo county

Bernalillo

HARRISON MID SCHL LIB 15,000 Albuquerque PSD

to plan, design, construct, improve, renovate, furnish and equip the library, including the purchase of equipment, 
furniture, fixtures, bookshelves  and information technology, at Harrison middle school in the Albuquerque public 
school district in Bernalillo county

Bernalillo
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HAWTHORNE ELEM SCHL BLDG RENOVATE 20,000 Albuquerque PSD

​to plan, design, construct, improve, renovate, furnish and equip buildings and facilities, including the purchase and 
installation of related equipment, infrastructure, fixtures and furniture, at Hawthorne elementary school in the 
Albuquerque public school district in Bernalillo county

Bernalillo

HAYES MID SCHL GROUNDS/TRACK AREAS PHASE 2 118,000 Albuquerque PSD

​to plan, design, renovate and construct improvements to the grounds, fields and track areas, including the purchase 
and installation of related equipment, furniture and landscaping, at Hayes middle school in the Albuquerque public 
school district in Bernalillo county

Bernalillo

HELEN CORDERO ELEM SCHL GROUNDS/PGRND 50,000 Albuquerque PSD

​to plan, design, construct, improve, landscape and equip the grounds and playgrounds, including the purchase and 
installation of related equipment, fencing, shade structures and drainage improvements, at Helen Cordero 
elementary school in the Albuquerque public school district in Bernalillo county

Bernalillo

HIGHLAND HIGH SCHL SECURITY 101,000 Albuquerque PSD

to purchase and install security cameras, including related equipment, information technology, an access card 
security system, furniture, infrastructure and improvements, at Highland high school in the Albuquerque public 
school district in Bernalillo county

Bernalillo

HOOVER MID SCHL GROUNDS/FLDS 30,000 Albuquerque PSD

to plan, design, construct, improve, landscape, equip and furnish the grounds, courtyards and fields, including the 
purchase and installation of related equipment, drainage, bleachers, fencing, shade structures and furniture, at 
Hoover middle school in the Albuquerque public school district in Bernalillo county

Bernalillo

HUBERT H. HUMPHREY ELEM SCHL GROUNDS/PGRND 150,000 Albuquerque PSD

​to plan, design, construct, improve, landscape and equip the grounds and playgrounds, including the purchase and 
installation of related equipment, fencing, shade structures and drainage improvements, at Hubert H. Humphrey 
elementary school in the Albuquerque public school district in Bernalillo county

Bernalillo

INTRNATL SCHL AT MESA DEL SOL CHARTER SCHL IMPROVE 75,000 Albuquerque

to plan, design, construct, renovate, furnish and equip buildings and grounds, including purchase and installation of 
related equipment, fencing, information technology, wiring, paving and infrastructure, and to construct and install 
physical education changing rooms for the international school at Mesa del Sol charter school in Bernalillo county

Bernalillo

JACKSON MID SCHL SECURITY 15,000 Albuquerque PSD

to purchase and install security cameras, including related equipment, information technology, an access card 
security system, furniture, infrastructure and improvements, at Jackson middle school in the Albuquerque public 
school district in Bernalillo county

Bernalillo

JAMES MONROE MID SCHL LIB 188,000 Albuquerque PSD

to plan, design, construct, improve, renovate, furnish and equip the library, including the purchase of equipment, 
furniture, fixtures, bookshelves and information technology, at James Monroe middle school in the Albuquerque 
public school district in Bernalillo county

Bernalillo

JANET KAHN SCHOOL OF INTEGRATED ARTS BLDGS/FCLTY 10,000 Albuquerque PSD

​to plan, design, construct, renovate, equip and improve the buildings and facilities, including the purchase and 
installation of fixtures, staging, choir risers, storage, shelving, lighting and sound systems, information technology 
and related equipment, furniture and infrastructure, at the Janet Kahn school of integrated arts in the Albuquerque 
public school district in Bernalillo county

Bernalillo

JEFFERSON MID SCHL FCLTIES 80,000 Albuquerque PSD

to plan, design, construct, renovate, equip and improve the facilities, including purchase and installation 
of a sound system, related equipment, furniture, information technology and infrastructure, at Jefferson middle 
school in the Albuquerque public school district in Bernalillo county

Bernalillo

JIMMY E. CARTER MID SCHL GROUNDS/PKG LOT 121,000 Albuquerque PSD

​to plan, design, construct, renovate and landscape the grounds, drainage and parking lot areas, including purchase 
and installation of related equipment, shade structures, furniture and fencing, at Jimmy E. Carter middle school in 
the Albuquerque public school district in Bernalillo county

Bernalillo

JOHN ADAMS MID SCHL LIB 119,000 Albuquerque PSD

to plan, design, construct, improve, renovate, furnish and equip the library, including the purchase of equipment, 
furniture, fixtures, bookshelves and information technology, at John Adams middle school in the Albuquerque public 
school district in Bernalillo county

Bernalillo
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JOHN BAKER ELEM SCHL GROUNDS/PGRND 116,000 Albuquerque PSD

​to plan, design, construct and landscape the grounds, courtyards, buildings and facilities, including the purchase 
and installation of related equipment, fencing, shade structures, benches, tables and furniture, at John Baker 
elementary school in the Albuquerque public school district in Bernalillo county

Bernalillo

JUNIOR ROTC PROGRAM BLDG/FCLTY 108,000 Albuquerque PSD

​to plan, design, construct and improve buildings and facilities for the junior reserve officers training corps program, 
including the purchase and installation of related equipment, furniture, trailers, rifles and marksmanship target 
ranges, in the Albuquerque public school district in Bernalillo county

Bernalillo

KENNEDY MID SCHL LIB PHASE 2 90,000 Albuquerque PSD

to plan, design, construct, improve, renovate, furnish and equip the library, including the purchase of equipment, 
furniture, fixtures, bookshelves  and information technology, at Kennedy middle school in the Albuquerque public 
school district in Bernalillo county

Bernalillo

KIRTLAND ELEM SCHL BLDG REN 25,000 Albuquerque PSD

​to plan, design, construct, improve, renovate, furnish and equip buildings and facilities, including the purchase and 
installation of related equipment, infrastructure, fixtures and furniture, at Kirtland elementary school in the 
Albuquerque public school district in Bernalillo county

Bernalillo

KIT CARSON ELEM SCHL SECURITY 80,000 Albuquerque PSD

to purchase and install security cameras, including related equipment, information technology, an access card 
security system, furniture, infrastructure and improvements, at Kit Carson elementary school in the Albuquerque 
public school district in Bernalillo county

Bernalillo

LA ACADEMIA DE ESPERANZA CHARTER SCHL IMPROVE ALB 50,000 Albuquerque PSD

to plan, design, construct, renovate, furnish, equip and improve the collaborative workshop, outdoor classroom, 
buildings and grounds, including the purchase and installation of fencing, related equipment, information 
technology, wiring and infrastructure, for la academia de Esperanza in Albuquerque in Bernalillo county

Bernalillo

LA CUEVA HIGH SCHL PERFORMING ARTS 150,000 Albuquerque PSD

to plan, design, construct, renovate, equip and improve the performing arts centers and ​facilities, including 
purchase and installation of stage curtains, seating, carpet, sound and lighting systems, refinishing of stages, 
information technology and related equipment, furniture and infrastructure, at La Cueva high school in the 
Albuquerque public school district in Bernalillo county

Bernalillo

LA LUZ ELEM SCHL GROUNDS/PGRND 50,000 Albuquerque PSD

to plan, design, construct, improve, landscape and equip the grounds and playgrounds, including the purchase and 
installation of related equipment, fencing, shade structures and drainage improvements, at La Luz elementary 
school in the Albuquerque public school district in Bernalillo county

Bernalillo

LA MESA ELEM SCHL SECURITY 50,000 Albuquerque PSD

to purchase and install security cameras, including related equipment, information technology, an access card 
security system, furniture, infrastructure and improvements, at La Mesa elementary school in the Albuquerque 
public school district in Bernalillo county

Bernalillo

LAVALAND ELEM SCHL LIB 107,000 Albuquerque PSD

to plan, design, construct, improve, renovate, furnish and equip the library, including the purchase of equipment, 
furniture, fixtures, bookshelves and information technology, at Lavaland elementary school in the Albuquerque 
public school district in Bernalillo county

Bernalillo

LEW WALLACE ELEM SCHL BLDG/GROUNDS 135,000 Albuquerque PSD

​to plan, design, construct, improve and landscape the grounds, courtyards, buildings and facilities, including the 
purchase and installation of related equipment, fencing, shade structures, benches, tables and furniture, at Lew 
Wallace elementary school in the Albuquerque public school district in Bernalillo county

Bernalillo

LONGFELLOW ELEM SCHL BLDG REN 65,000 Albuquerque PSD

​to plan, design, construct, improve, renovate, furnish and equip buildings and facilities, including the purchase and 
installation of related equipment, infrastructure, fixtures and furniture, at Longfellow elementary school in the 
Albuquerque public school district in Bernalillo county

Bernalillo

LOS PADILLAS ELEM SCHL GROUNDS/FIELDS 39,000 Albuquerque PSD

​to plan, design, construct, improve, landscape, equip and furnish the grounds, courtyards and fields, including the 
purchase and installation of related equipment, drainage, bleachers, fencing, shade structures and furniture, at Los 
Padillas elementary school in the Albuquerque public school district in Bernalillo county

Bernalillo
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LOS RANCHOS ELEM SCHL GROUNDS/PGRND PHASE 3 100,000 Albuquerque PSD

​​to plan, design, construct, improve, landscape and equip the grounds and playgrounds, including the purchase and 
installation of related equipment, fencing, shade structures and drainage improvements, at Los Ranchos 
elementary school in the Albuquerque public school district in Bernalillo county

Bernalillo

LOWELL ELEM SCHL BLDG/GROUNDS 35,000 Albuquerque PSD

​to plan, design, construct, improve and landscape the grounds, courtyards, buildings and facilities, including the 
purchase and installation of related equipment, fencing, shade structures, benches, tables and furniture, at Lowell 
elementary school in the Albuquerque public school district in Bernalillo county

Bernalillo

LYNDON B. JOHNSON MID SCHL LIB 230,000 Albuquerque PSD

to plan, design, construct, improve, renovate, furnish and equip the library, including the purchase of equipment, 
furniture, fixtures, bookshelves and information technology, at Lyndon B. Johnson middle school in the Albuquerque 
public school district in Bernalillo county

Bernalillo

MADISON MID SCHL GROUNDS/FIELDS 101,000 Albuquerque PSD

​to plan, design, construct, improve, landscape, equip and furnish the grounds, courtyards and fields, including the 
purchase and installation of related equipment, drainage, bleachers, fencing, shade structures and furniture, at 
Madison middle school in the Albuquerque public school district in Bernalillo county

Bernalillo

MANZANO HIGH SCHL FINE & PERFORMING ARTS PHASE 3 205,000 Albuquerque PSD

​to plan, design, construct, renovate, equip and improve the fine arts buildings, facilities and performing arts centers, 
including purchase and installation of stage curtains, seating, carpet, sound and lighting systems, refinishing of 
stages, information technology and related equipment, furniture and infrastructure, at Manzano high school in the 
Albuquerque public school district in Bernalillo county

Bernalillo

MANZANO MESA ELEM SCHL GROUNDS/PGRND 150,000 Albuquerque PSD

​to plan, design, construct, improve, landscape and equip the grounds and playgrounds, including the purchase and 
installation of related equipment, fencing, shade structures and drainage improvements, at Manzano Mesa 
elementary school in the Albuquerque public school district in Bernalillo county

Bernalillo

MARIE M. HUGHES ELEM SCHL BLDG/GROUNDS 35,000 Albuquerque PSD

​to plan, design, construct, improve and landscape the grounds, courtyards, buildings and facilities, including the 
purchase and installation of related equipment, fencing, shade structures, benches, tables and furniture, at Marie 
M. Hughes elementary school in the Albuquerque public school district in Bernalillo county

Bernalillo

MARK TWAIN ELEM SCHL GROUNDS/PKG LOT 229,000 Albuquerque PSD

​to plan, design, construct, renovate, improve and landscape the grounds, drainage and parking lot areas, including 
purchase and installation of related equipment, shade structures, furniture and fencing, at Mark Twain elementary 
school in the Albuquerque public school district in Bernalillo county

Bernalillo

MATHESON PARK ELEM SCHL SECURITY 81,000 Albuquerque PSD

to purchase and install security cameras, including related equipment, information technology, an access card 
security system, furniture, infrastructure and improvements, at Matheson Park elementary school in the 
Albuquerque public school district in Bernalillo county

Bernalillo

MCCOLLUM ELEM SCHL LIB 79,000 Albuquerque PSD

to plan, design, construct, improve, renovate, furnish and equip the library, including the purchase of equipment, 
furniture, fixtures, bookshelves and information technology, at McCollum elementary school in the Albuquerque 
public school district in Bernalillo county

Bernalillo

MCKINLEY MID SCHL EQUIP 35,000 Albuquerque PSD

​​to purchase and install fixtures, furniture and equipment at McKinley middle school in the Albuquerque public 
school district in Bernalillo county

Bernalillo

MEDIA ARTS COLLABORATIVE CHARTER SCHL EXPANSION 600,000 Albuquerque

for the expansion of the Media arts collaborative charter school in Albuquerque in Bernalillo county

Bernalillo

MEDIA ARTS COLLABORATIVE CHARTER SCHL UPGRADE 72,000 Albuquerque

to plan, design and upgrade educational technology equipment and infrastructure at the Media Arts collaborative 
charter school in Albuquerque in Bernalillo county

Bernalillo

MISSION AVE ELEM SCHL BLDG/GROUNDS PHASE 2 135,000 Albuquerque PSD

t​o plan, design, construct, improve and landscape the grounds, courtyards, buildings and facilities, including the 
purchase and installation of related equipment, fencing, shade structures, benches, tables and furniture, at Mission 
Avenue elementary school in the Albuquerque public school district in Bernalillo county

Bernalillo
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MITCHELL ELEM SCHL LIB 147,000 Albuquerque PSD

to plan, design, construct, improve, renovate, furnish and equip the library, including the purchase of equipment, 
furniture, fixtures, bookshelves and information technology, at Mitchell elementary school in the Albuquerque public 
school district in Bernalillo county

Bernalillo

MONTE VISTA ELEM SCHL SECURITY PHASE 3 15,000 Albuquerque PSD

to purchase and install security cameras, including related equipment, information technology, an access card 
security system, furniture, infrastructure and improvements, at Monte Vista elementary school in the Albuquerque 
public school district in Bernalillo county

Bernalillo

MONTESSORI ELEM SCHL VEHICLE/BLDGS/GROUNDS 75,000 Albuquerque

to purchase a vehicle and to plan, design, construct, renovate, furnish and equip buildings and grounds, including 
related equipment, fencing, information technology, wiring and infrastructure, for the Montessori elementary school 
in Albuquerque in Bernalillo county

Bernalillo

MONTEZUMA ELEM SCHL GROUNDS/PGRNDS 30,000 Albuquerque PSD

​to plan, design, construct, improve, landscape and equip the grounds and playgrounds, including the purchase and 
installation of related equipment, fencing, shade structures and drainage improvements, at Montezuma elementary 
school in the Albuquerque public school district in Bernalillo county

Bernalillo

MOUNTAIN VIEW ELEM SCHL SECURITY 80,000 Albuquerque PSD

to purchase and install security cameras, including related equipment, information technology, an access card 
security system, furniture, infrastructure and improvements, at Mountain View elementary school in the 
Albuquerque public school district in Bernalillo county

Bernalillo

NAVAJO ELEM SCHL GROUNDS/PGRND 50,000 Albuquerque PSD

​to plan, design, construct, improve, landscape and equip the grounds and playgrounds, including the purchase and 
installation of related equipment, fencing, shade structures and drainage improvements, at Navajo elementary 
school in the Albuquerque public school district in Bernalillo county

Bernalillo

NEW FUTURES HIGH SCHL GROUNDS/FIELDS PHASE 2 25,000 Albuquerque PSD

to plan, design, construct, improve, landscape, equip and furnish the grounds, courtyards and fields, including the 
purchase and installation of related equipment, drainage, bleachers, fencing, shade structures and furniture, at New 
Futures high school in the Albuquerque public school district in Bernalillo county

Bernalillo

NORTH STAR ELEM SCHL GROUNDS/TRACK 145,000 Albuquerque PSD

​to plan, design, renovate and construct improvements to the grounds, fields and track areas, including the purchase 
and installation of related equipment, furniture and landscaping, at North Star elementary school in the Albuquerque 
public school district in Bernalillo county

Bernalillo

NUESTROS VALORES CH SCHL IMPROVE 60,000 Albuquerque PSD

to plan, design, construct, renovate, furnish and equip buildings and grounds, including purchase and installation of 
fencing and related equipment, and to purchase and install information technology, including related furniture, 
equipment and infrastructure, at Nuestros Valores charter school in the Albuquerque public school district in 
Bernalillo county

Bernalillo

ONATE ELEM SCHL GROUNDS/PGRND PHASE 2 87,000 Albuquerque PSD

​to plan, design, construct, improve, landscape and equip the grounds and playgrounds, including the purchase and 
installation of related equipment, fencing, shade structures and drainage improvements, at Onate elementary 
school in the Albuquerque public school district in Bernalillo county

Bernalillo

OSUNA ELEM SCHL LIB 101,000 Albuquerque PSD

to plan, design, construct, improve, renovate, furnish and equip the library, including the purchase of equipment, 
furniture, fixtures, bookshelves and information technology, at Osuna elementary school in the Albuquerque public 
school district in Bernalillo county

Bernalillo

PAINTED SKY ELEM SCHL GROUNDS/PGRND PHASE 2 96,000 Albuquerque PSD

​to plan, design, construct, improve, landscape and equip the grounds and playgrounds, including the purchase and 
installation of related equipment, fencing, shade structures and drainage improvements, at Painted Sky elementary 
school in the Albuquerque public school district in Bernalillo county

Bernalillo

PAJARITO ELEM SCHL GROUNDS/TRACK PHASE 2 146,000 Albuquerque PSD

​to plan, design, renovate and construct improvements to the grounds, fields and track areas, including the purchase 
and installation of related equipment, furniture and landscaping, at Pajarito elementary school in the Albuquerque 
public school district in Bernalillo county

Bernalillo
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PETROGLYPH ELEM SCHL SECURITY 91,000 Albuquerque PSD

to purchase and install security cameras, including related equipment, information technology, access card security 
system, furniture, infrastructure and improvements, at Petroglyph elementary school in the Albuquerque public 
school district in Bernalillo county

Bernalillo

POLK MID SCHL GROUNDS/TRACK 335,000 Albuquerque PSD

​to plan, design, renovate and construct improvements to the grounds, fields and track areas, including the purchase 
and installation of related equipment, furniture and landscaping, at Polk middle school in the Albuquerque public 
school district in Bernalillo county

Bernalillo

REGINALD CHAVEZ ELEM SCHL BLDG/GROUNDS 18,000 Albuquerque PSD

​to plan, design, construct, improve and landscape the grounds, courtyards, buildings and facilities, including the 
purchase and installation of related equipment, fencing, shade structures, benches, tables and furniture, at 
Reginald Chavez elementary school in the Albuquerque public school district in Bernalillo county

Bernalillo

RIO GRANDE HIGH SCHL SECURITY 150,000 Albuquerque PSD

to purchase and install security cameras, including related equipment, information technology, an access card 
security system, furniture, infrastructure and improvements, at Rio Grande high school in the Albuquerque public 
school district in Bernalillo county

Bernalillo

ROBERT F. KENNEDY HIGH CH SCHL IMPROVE & VEH 75,000 Albuquerque PSD

to plan, design, construct, renovate, furnish and equip buildings and grounds, including purchase and installation of 
fencing, information technology and related equipment, furniture and infrastructure, and to purchase activity 
vehicles for the Robert F. Kennedy high charter school in the Albuquerque public school district in Bernalillo county

Bernalillo

ROOSEVELT MID SCHL LIB 50,000 Albuquerque PSD

to plan, design, construct, improve, renovate, furnish and equip the library, including the purchase of equipment, 
furniture, fixtures, bookshelves and information technology, at Roosevelt middle school in the Albuquerque public 
school district in Bernalillo county

Bernalillo

RUDOLFO ANAYA ELEM SCHL GROUNDS/TRACK 232,000 Albuquerque PSD

​to plan, design, renovate and construct improvements to the grounds, fields and track areas, including the purchase 
and installation of related equipment, furniture and landscaping, at Rudolfo Anaya elementary school in the 
Albuquerque public school district in Bernalillo county

Bernalillo

S VALLEY ACAD CH SCHL BLDG & GROUNDS 77,384 Albuquerque PSD

to plan, design, construct, improve, renovate, furnish and equip buildings, facilities and grounds, including the 
purchase and installation of related equipment, infrastructure, a sound system, benches, tables, fixtures and 
furniture, for South Valley academy charter school in the Albuquerque public school district in Bernalillo county

Bernalillo

SAHQ ACADEMY CHARTER SCHL CONSTRUCT EQUIP 50,000 Albuquerque

to plan, design, construct, renovate and equip the buildings and grounds at the Student Athlete Headquarters 
charter school, including the purchase and installation of furniture, information technology and related equipment 
and infrastructure, in Albuquerque in Bernalillo county

Bernalillo

SAN ANTONITO ELEM SCHL GRNDS/PGROUNDS 150,000 Albuquerque PSD

​to plan, design, construct, improve, landscape and equip the grounds and playgrounds, including the purchase and 
installation of related equipment, fencing, shade structures and drainage improvements, at San Antonito elementary 
school in the Albuquerque public school district in Bernalillo county

Bernalillo

SANDIA BASE ELEM SCHL BLDG/GROUNDS 56,000 Albuquerque PSD

​to plan, design, construct, improve and landscape the grounds, courtyards, buildings and facilities, including the 
purchase and installation of related equipment, fencing, shade structures, benches, tables and furniture, at Sandia 
Base elementary school in the Albuquerque public school district in Bernalillo county

Bernalillo

SANDIA HIGH SCHL PERFORMING ARTS CTRS 201,000 Albuquerque PSD

to plan, design, construct, renovate, equip and improve the performing arts centers and ​facilities, including 
purchase and installation of stage curtains, seating, carpet, sound and lighting systems, refinishing of stages, 
information technology and related equipment, furniture and infrastructure, at Sandia high school in the 
Albuquerque public school district in Bernalillo county

Bernalillo

SANDIA HIGH SCHL SECURITY 152,000 Albuquerque PSD

to purchase and install security cameras, including related equipment, information technology, an access card 
security system, furniture, infrastructure and improvements, at Sandia high school in the Albuquerque public school 
district in Bernalillo county

Bernalillo
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SEVEN-BAR ELEM SCHL GROUNDS/PGRND IMPROVE 150,000 Albuquerque PSD

to plan, design, construct, improve, landscape and equip the grounds and playgrounds, including the purchase and 
installation of related equipment, fencing, shade structures and drainage improvements, at Seven-Bar elementary 
school in the Albuquerque public school district in Bernalillo county

Bernalillo

SIERRA VISTA ELEM SCHL SECURITY 98,000 Albuquerque PSD

to purchase and install security cameras, including related equipment, information technology, an access card 
security system, furniture, infrastructure and improvements, at Sierra Vista elementary school in the Albuquerque 
public school district in Bernalillo county

Bernalillo

SOMBRA DEL MONTE ELEM SCHL BLDG/GROUNDS PHASE 2 120,000 Albuquerque PSD

​to plan, design, construct, improve and landscape the grounds, courtyards, buildings and facilities, including the 
purchase and installation of related equipment, fencing, shade structures, benches, tables and furniture, at Sombra 
del Monte elementary school in the Albuquerque public school district in Bernalillo county

Bernalillo

SOUTH VALLEY PREPARATORY CH SCHL PORTABLES 100,000 Albuquerque

to acquire land and to plan, design, construct, purchase, equip and install portable classrooms at the South Valley 
preparatory charter school in Albuquerque in Bernalillo county

Bernalillo

SUSIE R. MARMON ELEM SCHL SECURITY 91,000 Albuquerque PSD

to purchase and install security cameras, including related equipment, information technology, an access card 
security system, furniture, infrastructure and improvements, at Susie R. Marmon elementary school in the 
Albuquerque public school district in Bernalillo county

Bernalillo

TAFT MID SCHL GROUNDS/FIELDS 30,000 Albuquerque PSD

to plan, design, construct, improve, landscape, equip and furnish the grounds, courtyards and fields, including the 
purchase and installation of related equipment, drainage, bleachers, fencing, shade structures and furniture, at Taft 
middle school in the Albuquerque public school district in Bernalillo county

Bernalillo

TAYLOR MID SCHL SECURITY 120,000 Albuquerque PSD

to purchase and install security cameras, including related equipment, information technology, access card security 
system, furniture, infrastructure and improvements, at Taylor middle school in the Albuquerque public school district 
in Bernalillo county

Bernalillo

TIERRA ADENTRO CH SCHL INFO TECH EQUIPMENT 50,000 Albuquerque

to purchase and install equipment, including information technology and related furniture, equipment and 
infrastructure, for Tierra Adentro charter school in Albuquerque in Bernalillo county

Bernalillo

TIERRA ANTIGUA ELEM SCHL SECURITY 83,000 Albuquerque PSD

to purchase and install security cameras, including related equipment, information technology, an access card 
security system, furniture, infrastructure and improvements, at Tierra Antigua elementary school in the Albuquerque 
public school district in Bernalillo county

Bernalillo

TOMASITA ELEM SCHL GROUNDS/PGRND 225,000 Albuquerque PSD

​to plan, design, construct, improve, landscape and equip the grounds and playgrounds, including the purchase and 
installation of related equipment, fencing, shade structures and drainage improvements, at Tomasita elementary 
school in the Albuquerque public school district in Bernalillo county

Bernalillo

TONY HILLERMAN MID SCHL GROUNDS/FIELDS PHASE 3 133,000 Albuquerque PSD

to plan, design, construct, improve, landscape, equip and furnish the grounds, courtyards and fields, including the 
purchase and installation of related equipment, drainage, bleachers, fencing, shade structures and furniture, at 
Tony Hillerman middle school in the Albuquerque public school district in Bernalillo county

Bernalillo

TRUMAN MID SCHL GROUNDS/PKG LOT 60,000 Albuquerque PSD

​to plan, design, construct, renovate, improve and landscape the grounds, drainage and parking lot areas, including 
the purchase and installation of related equipment, shade structures, furniture and fencing, at Truman middle 
school in the Albuquerque public school district in Bernalillo county

Bernalillo

VALLE VISTA ELEM SCHL GROUNDS/PGRND 150,000 Albuquerque PSD

​to plan, design, construct, improve, landscape and equip the grounds and playgrounds, including the purchase and 
installation of related equipment, fencing, shade structures and drainage improvements, at Valle Vista elementary 
school in the Albuquerque public school district in Bernalillo county

Bernalillo
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VALLEY HIGH SCHL BLDG/GROUNDS PHASE 3 116,000 Albuquerque PSD

​to plan, design, construct, improve and landscape the grounds, courtyards, buildings and facilities, including the 
purchase and installation of related equipment, fencing, shade structures, benches, tables and furniture, at Valley 
high school in the Albuquerque public school district in Bernalillo county

Bernalillo

VALLEY HIGH SCHL FINE & PERFORMING ARTS PHASE 3 125,000 Albuquerque PSD

​to plan, design, construct, renovate, equip and improve the fine arts buildings, facilities and performing arts centers, 
including purchase and installation of stage curtains, seating, carpet, sound and lighting systems, refinishing of 
stages, information technology and related equipment, furniture and infrastructure, at Valley high school in the 
Albuquerque public school district in Bernalillo county

Bernalillo

VAN BUREN MID SCHL SECURITY 100,000 Albuquerque PSD

to purchase and install security cameras, including related equipment, information technology, an access card 
security system, furniture, infrastructure and improvements, at Van Buren middle school in the Albuquerque public 
school district in Bernalillo county

Bernalillo

VENTANA RANCH ELEM SCHL GROUNDS/PKG LOT 10,000 Albuquerque PSD

​to plan, design, construct, renovate, improve and landscape the grounds, drainage and parking lot areas, including 
the purchase and installation of related equipment, shade structures, furniture, fencing and signage, at Ventana 
Ranch elementary school in the Albuquerque public school district in Bernalillo county

Bernalillo

VISION QUEST ALTERNATIVE MID SCHL GROUNDS/FIELDS 25,000 Albuquerque PSD

to plan, design, construct, improve, landscape, equip and furnish the grounds, courtyards and fields, including the 
purchase and installation of related equipment, drainage, bleachers, fencing, shade structures and furniture, at 
Vision Quest alternative middle school in the Albuquerque public school district in Bernalillo county

Bernalillo

VOLCANO VISTA HIGH SCHL GROUNDS/FIELDS 36,000 Albuquerque PSD

​to plan, design, construct, improve, landscape, equip and furnish the grounds, courtyards and fields, including the 
purchase and installation of related equipment, drainage, bleachers, fencing, shade structures and furniture, at 
Volcano Vista high school in the Albuquerque public school district in Bernalillo county

Bernalillo

VOLCANO VISTA HIGH SCHL SCOREBOARDS 61,000 Albuquerque PSD

​to plan, design, construct, improve, landscape, equip and furnish the grounds, courtyards and fields, including the 
purchase and installation of related equipment, drainage, bleachers, fencing, shade structures, scoreboards and 
furniture, at Volcano Vista high school in the Albuquerque public school district in Bernalillo county

Bernalillo

WASHINGTON MID SCHL LIB PHASE 2 113,000 Albuquerque PSD

to plan, design, construct, improve, renovate, furnish and equip the library, including the purchase of equipment, 
furniture, fixtures, bookshelves and information technology, at Washington middle school in the Albuquerque public 
school district in Bernalillo county

Bernalillo

WEST MESA HIGH SCHL GROUNDS/FIELDS 100,000 Albuquerque PSD

to plan, design, construct, improve, landscape, equip and furnish the grounds, courtyards and fields, including the 
purchase and installation of related equipment, drainage, bleachers, fencing, shade structures and furniture, at 
West Mesa high school in the Albuquerque public school district in Bernalillo county

Bernalillo

WHERRY ELEM SCHL GROUNDS/PGRND 110,000 Albuquerque PSD

​to plan, design, construct, improve, landscape and equip the grounds and playgrounds, including the purchase and 
installation of related equipment, fencing, shade structures and drainage improvements, at Wherry elementary 
school in the Albuquerque public school district in Bernalillo county

Bernalillo

WHITTIER ELEM SCHL SECURITY 100,000 Albuquerque PSD

to purchase and install security cameras, including related equipment, information technology, an access card 
security system, furniture, infrastructure and improvements, at Whittier elementary school in the Albuquerque public 
school district in Bernalillo county

Bernalillo

WILSON MID SCHL GROUNDS/PKG LOT 76,000 Albuquerque PSD

​to plan, design, construct, renovate, improve and landscape the grounds, drainage and parking lot areas, including 
the purchase and installation of related equipment, shade structures, furniture, fencing and signage, at Wilson 
middle school in the Albuquerque public school district in Bernalillo county

Bernalillo

ZIA ELEM SCHL GROUNDS/PKG LOT 38,000 Albuquerque PSD

​to plan, design, construct, renovate, improve and landscape the grounds, drainage and parking lot areas, including 
purchase and installation of related equipment, shade structures, furniture, fencing and signage, at Zia elementary 
school in the Albuquerque public school district in Bernalillo county

Bernalillo
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ZUNI ELEM SCHL GROUNDS/PLAYGROUNDS 58,000 Albuquerque PSD

​to plan, design, construct, improve, landscape and equip the grounds and playgrounds, including the purchase and 
installation of related equipment, fencing, shade structures and drainage improvements, at Zuni elementary school 
in the Albuquerque public school district in Bernalillo county

Bernalillo

HIGH PLAINS REC SECURITY SYSTEM INSTALL RATON 55,000 Raton

to plan, design, purchase, equip and install a security system in the High Plains regional education cooperative 
building in Raton in Colfax county

Colfax

MELROSE PSD ACTIVITY BUS PRCHS EQUIP 150,000 Melrose PSD

to purchase and equip an activity bus for the Melrose public school district in Curry county

Curry

J. PAUL TAYLOR ACAD CH SCHL PGRND LAS CRUCES 120,000 Las Cruces

to plan, design, construct and equip playgrounds, including tennis courts, four-square courts, walking track and 
fences, for the J. Paul Taylor academy charter school in Las Cruces in Dona Ana county

Dona Ana

CARLSBAD HIGH SCHL INTERACTIVE SMART BOARDS 200,000 Carlsbad MSD

to plan, design, purchase and install interactive smart boards, including related equipment, furniture and 
infrastructure, at Carlsbad high school in the Carlsbad municipal school district in Eddy county

Eddy

ROSELAWN ELEM SCHL HVAC ARTESIA 225,000 Artesia PSD

to plan, design, construct, purchase and install heating, ventilation and air conditioning systems in Roselawn 
elementary school in Artesia in Eddy county

Eddy

COBRE CSD ACTIVITY BUS PURCHASE GRANT CO 185,000 Cobre CSD

to purchase and equip an activity bus for the Cobre consolidated school district in Bayard in Grant county

Grant

COBRE CSD TECH IMPROVEMENTS GRANT CO 125,000 Cobre CSD

to plan, design, purchase, construct, equip and furnish technology improvements in the Cobre consolidated school 
district in Bayard in Grant county

Grant

SILVER CSD DAYCARE FACILITY CONSTRUCT 350,000 Silver CSD

to plan, design, demolish, construct, equip and furnish improvements and to purchase furniture for the Growing 
Tree daycare facility in the Silver consolidated school district in Grant county

Grant

LOVINGTON MSD LACES & HEALTH CTR ACCESS IMPROVE 125,000 Lovington MSD

to plan, design and construct a dropoff lane, fencing and parking improvements to the Lovington autism center for 
educational services and the site-based health clinic of the Lovington municipal school district in Lea county

Lea

MORA HIGH SCHL GYM ACCESSIBLE RESTROOMS 250,875 Mora ISD

to plan, design, renovate and equip accessible bathrooms and water fountains in the gymnasium lobby at Mora high 
school in Mora county

Mora

MORA ISD BUS PURCHASE 200,000 Mora ISD

to purchase and equip a bus for the Mora independent school district in Mora county

Mora

MORA ISD FIRE ALARM SYSTEMS INSTALL 100,000 Mora ISD

to plan, design, purchase and install fire alarm systems in the schools in the Mora independent school district in 
Mora county

Mora

CARINOS DE LOS NINOS CH SCHL INFO TECH 60,000 Espanola

to plan, design, construct, renovate and equip buildings and grounds and to purchase and install information 
technology and related equipment, furniture and infrastructure at Carinos de los Ninos charter school in Espanola in 
Rio Arriba county

Rio Arriba

DORA CSD BUS & CAR PORTS CONSTRUCT 50,000 Dora CSD

to plan, design and construct bus and car ports  at Dora consolidated schools in Roosevelt county

Roosevelt

FLOYD MSD FIRE DETECTION SYS ROOSEVELT CO 100,000 Floyd MSD

to plan, design, purchase and install a fire detection and alarm system in the Floyd municipal school district in 
Roosevelt county

Roosevelt

FLOYD MSD SECURITY DOORS 25,000 Floyd

to purchase and install security doors at the Floyd municipal school district in Roosevelt county

Roosevelt
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PECOS ISD INTERCOM SYSTEM REPLACE 50,000 Pecos ISD

to plan, design, purchase and install an intercom system at the Pecos independent school district middle and high 
schools in Pecos in San Miguel county

San Miguel

THE ASK ACADEMY BLDGS/GROUNDS IMPROVE RIO RANCHO 83,000 Rio Rancho

to purchase equipment and to plan, design, construct, renovate, furnish, equip and install improvements to the 
buildings and grounds, including outdoor tables, benches, shade structures, fencing, information technology, wiring 
and infrastructure, for The ASK academy in Rio Rancho in Sandoval county

Sandoval

NM SCHL FOR THE ARTS CAMPUS IMPROVE 6,801,400

to plan, design, develop the site, construct and furnish a dormitory, kitchen and dining facilities for New Mexico 
school for the arts, a statewide, state-chartered charter school

Statewide

UNM-GALLUP NAVCAR NATIVE LANGUAGE ROBOTICS EQUIP 65,000

to purchase and construct native American voice-controlled autonomous robot equipment for in-school and after-
school programs to engage youth in native language programs statewide

Statewide

TAOS MSD ACTIVITY BUS PURCHASE 166,865 Taos MSD

to purchase and equip an activity bus for the Taos municipal school district in Taos county

Taos

SCHOOL OF DREAMS ACADEMY SECURITY SYSTEM 200,000 Los Lunas

to purchase, construct and install a camera security system and related information technology, equipment and 
infrastructure at School of Dreams academy in Los Lunas in Valencia county

Valencia

Agency: ENGINEER, OFFICE OF THE STATE

DONA ANA CO BRAHMAN DAM DRAGONFLY CHANNEL 8,404,000

to plan, design and construct an outfall channel for the Brahman dam in Dona Ana county

Dona Ana

DONA ANA CO BROWN FARM FLOOD CONTROL FCLTY 5,100,000

to plan, design and construct a flood control facility, including a holding pond, from the Sandhill arroyo to the Dona 
Ana drain in Dona Ana county

Dona Ana

FARMINGTON VILLA VIEW STORM DRAINAGE FACILITY 2,455,902 Farmington

to acquire land for and to plan, design and construct the Villa View storm drainage detention facility, including 
detention ponds and related infrastructure, in Farmington in San Juan county

San Juan

LAS VEGAS DAM CONSTRUCT 10,000,000 Las Vegas

to plan, design and construct a dam in Las Vegas in San Miguel county

San Miguel

CACTUS POND FLOOD CONTROL-SSCAFCA 250,000 Rio Rancho

to plan, design and construct flood control mechanisms, including detention facilities, storm drains, culvert 
crossings and grade control structures, for the southern Sandoval county arroyo flood control authority in Sandoval 
county

Sandoval

LOMITAS NEGRAS FLOOD CONTROL FCLTY-SSCAFCA 250,000 Rio Rancho

to plan, design and construct flood control mechanisms, including a detention facility, a diversion weir and bank 
stabilization, for the southern Sandoval county arroyo flood control authority in Sandoval county

Sandoval

RIO RANCHO LOS MONTOYAS ARROYO FLOOD CONTROL 554,719 Rio Rancho

to plan, design and construct flood control improvements along Los Montoyas arroyo near the Rio Rancho sports 
complex in Rio Rancho in Sandoval county

Sandoval

EMWT RGNL WATER ASSOC WATER DISPENSER STA MCINTOSH 153,000 McIntosh

to acquire water rights and to plan, design and construct a drinking water dispenser station for the Estancia, 
Moriarty, Willard and Torrance regional water association, as phase 1 of the Estancia basin regional water system 
in McIntosh in Torrance county

Torrance

BELEN REID MAE POND FLOOD CONTROL CONSTRUCT 400,000 Belen

to plan, design and construct Reid Mae pond and related flood control improvements in Belen in Valencia county

Valencia

Agency: PARKS DIVISION OF THE ENERGY, MINERALS AND NATURAL RESOURCES DEPAR
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VIETNAM VETERANS MEM STATE PARK COLFAX COUNTY 283,500

to plan, design, construct and equip improvements to the Vietnam veterans memorial state park in Colfax county

Colfax

Agency: UNIVERSITY OF NEW MEXICO

UNM ALCOHOLISM/SUBSTANCE ABUSE/ADDICTION CTR 50,000 Albuquerque

to purchase and install equipment and furnishings for a center on alcoholism, substance abuse and addictions at 
the university of New Mexico in Albuquerque in Bernalillo county

Bernalillo

UNM BASKETBALL PRACTICE FACILITY 150,000 Albuquerque

to purchase, install, equip and make improvements to the basketball practice facility at the university of New Mexico 
in Albuquerque in Bernalillo county

Bernalillo

UNM CAMPUS SAFETY LIGHTING 150,000 Albuquerque

to plan, design, purchase and install campus safety lighting at the university of New Mexico in Albuquerque in 
Bernalillo county

Bernalillo

UNM FARRIS ENGINEERING BLDG/LEED LAB 500,000 Albuquerque

to plan, design, construct, renovate, equip and furnish the Farris engineering building to house the leadership in 
energy and environmental design laboratory at the university of New Mexico in Albuquerque in Bernalillo county

Bernalillo

UNM MUSIC DEPT FACILITY IMPROVE 150,000 Albuquerque

to plan, design and construct improvements and to purchase and install equipment for the music department facility 
at the university of New Mexico in Albuquerque in Bernalillo county

Bernalillo

UNM OLYMPIC SPORTS TRAINING FACILITY 150,000 Albuquerque

to plan and design an Olympic sports training facility at the university of New Mexico in Albuquerque in Bernalillo 
county

Bernalillo

UNM POPEJOY HALL RESTROOMS IMPROVE 150,000 Albuquerque

to plan, design, construct and make improvements to the restroom facilities at Popejoy hall at the university of New 
Mexico in Albuquerque in Bernalillo county

Bernalillo

UNM STUDENT VETERAN SUPPORT CTR IMPROVE 100,000 Albuquerque

to plan, design, purchase, equip and make improvements to the student veteran support center at the university of 
New Mexico in Albuquerque in Bernalillo county

Bernalillo

UNM TOW DIEHM ATHLETIC FACILITY IMPROVE 150,000 Albuquerque

to plan, design, renovate, construct, purchase, install and equip the L.F. "Tow" Diehm athletic facility at the 
university of New Mexico in Albuquerque

Bernalillo

Agency: WESTERN NEW MEXICO UNIVERSITY

WNMU CAMPUS-WIDE IMPROVEMENTS 5,443,000 Silver City

to plan, design, demolish, construct, equip and install infrastructure renovations and improvements campus-wide, 
including fire alarm systems, paving, drainage, equipment, sidewalks, site work and security, at western New 
Mexico university in Silver City in Grant county

Grant

WNMU GENERATOR PURCHASE 216,500 Silver City

to plan, design, construct, purchase and equip a generator and enclosure on the campus of western New Mexico 
university in Silver City in Grant county

Grant

WNMU HARLAN HALL SCIENCE BLDG REN IMPROVE 3,100,000 Silver City

to plan, design, construct, demolish, purchase, renovate, equip and install improvements, including asbestos 
abatement, to Harlan hall science building at western New Mexico university in Silver City in Grant county

Grant

WNMU ROOFS REPAIR REPLACE 481,500 Silver City

to plan, design, remove, construct, repair and replace roofs throughout the campus at western New Mexico 
university in Silver City in Grant county

Grant

WNMU VIRTUAL DESKTOP INFRASTRUCTURE 255,000 Silver City

to plan, design, purchase, equip and install virtual desktop infrastructure, including related equipment, to enable 
remote access to campus lab applications at western New Mexico university in Silver City in Grant county

Grant
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End of Report

2,176,200,506
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